I NVI TATION TO BID NO  10- X-2215072
STATE OF ALABANA

DEPTARTMVENT OF FI NANCE REQ ACENCY 1999999
Dl VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG PURCHASI NG DI VI SI ON
AGENCY REQ. NO. : AG

T- NUMBER : T710
DATE | SSUED : 12/ 08/ 09
I NVI TATION TO BI D VENDOR NO. :
VENDOR PHONE NO. :
SNAP REQ. NO. : 1433472
BUYER NAME : JENNI FER LORETZ
FOR: FI NGERPRI NT SCANNI NG EQUI P BUYER PHONE NO. : (334) 242-7370-
PURCHASI NG PHONE NO (334) 242-7250

Bl D MUST BE RECEI VED BEFORE:
DATE: 12/29/09 TIME: 5:00 PM

BI DS WLL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
DATE: 12/30/09 TIME: 10:00 AM

TO BE COVMPLETED BY VENDOR

I NFORVATI ON | N THI' S SECTI ON SHOULD BE PROVI DED, AS APPROPRI ATE. Bl D RESPONSE
MUST BE IN I NK OR TYPED WTH ORI G NAL SI GNATURE AND NOTARI ZATI ON.

1. DELIVERY: CAN BE MADE DAYSOR WEEKS AFTER RECEI PT OF ORDER
2. TERMVE: (DI SCOUNTS ARE TAKEN W THOUT REGARD TO DATE OF PAYMENT.)
3. PRICE VALID FOR ACCEPTANCE WTHIN DAYS.

4. VENDOR ATI ON REFERENCE NUVBER, | F ANY:

(TH'S NUMBER W LL APPEAR ON THE PURCHASE ORDER)
5. E-MAI L ADDRESS:

| NTERNET WEBSI TE:
6. GENERAL CONTRACTCOR' S LI CENSE NO

TYPE OF G C. LI CENSE:

*axxk | NPORTANT NOTE; * %%

BI DDERS MUST COMPLY W TH ALL "BI D RESPONSE | NSTRUCTI ONS" ON PAGE 2, TO I NCLUDE
ITEM 7 - OCOPY REQUI REMENT.

RETURN | NVI TATI ON TO BI D:

US MAIL COURI ER

STATE OF ALABANA
DEPARTMENT OF FI NANCE

DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG

P O BOX 302620
MONTGOMVERY, AL 36130-2620

STATE OF ALABANA

DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG

RSA UNI ON BUI LDI NG

100 N. UNTON ST., SUTE 192
MONTGOMERY, AL 36104

S| GNATURE AND NOTARI ZATI ON REQUI RED
| HAVE READ THE ENTIRE Bl D AND AGREE TO FURNI SH EACH | TEM OFFERED AT THE PRI CE QUOTED.
| HERBY AFFI RM | HAVE NOT BEEN I N ANY AGREEMENT OR COLLUSI ON AMONG BI DDERS | N
RESTRAI NT OF FREEDOM OF COWPETI TI ON BY AGREEMENT TO BID AT A FI XED PRICE OR TO
REFRAI N FROM BI DDI NG

SWORN TO AND

FEITN OR SSN AUTHORI ZED ST GNATURE (TNK)
SUBSCRI BED BEFORE ME THI S

COVPANY NAMVE TYPE PRINT AUTHORI ZED NAVE

_ DAY OF

MAI' L ADDRESS TITTLE

NOTARY PUBLT C
TERM EXP:

aTy, STATE, zZIP TOLL FREE NUMBER ~—

PHONE TNCLUDI NG AREA CODE FAX NUVBER



STANDARD TERMS & CONDI Tl ONS VENDOR NAME
VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE 2
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T- NUMBER

T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

AUTHORI TY:
THE DEPARTMENT OF FI NANCE CODE OF ADM NI STRATI VE PROCEDURE, CHAPTER 355-4-1 EFFECTI VE
DECEMBER 20, 2001 IS | NCORPCRATED BY REFERENCE AND MADE A PART CF T HI S DOCUMENT. TO RECEI VE A
COPY CALL (334)242-7250, OR OUR WEBSI TE WAV PURCHASI NG. ALABANVA. GOV .

| NFORVATI ON AND ASSI STANCE TO M NORI TY BUSI NESSES | N THE TECHNI CAL COVPLETI ON OF REQUI RED FORMS NAY BE
OBTAI NED FROM THE OFFI CE OF M NORI TY BUSI NESS ENTERPRI SE, 1-800-447-4191.

BI D (1 TB) RESPONSE | NSTRUCTI ONS REV: 09/18/09
1. TO SUBM T A RESPONSI VE BI D, READ THESE | NSTRUCTI ONS, ALL TERMS, CONDI TI ONS AND SPECI FI CATI ONS.

2. Bl D ENVELOPES/ PACKAGES/ BOXES MUST BE | DENTI FI ED ON FRONT, PREFERABLY LONER LEFT CORNER AND BE
VI S| BLE WTH THE BI D NUVMBER AND OPENI NG DATE. EACH | NDI VI DUAL BI D (I DENTI FI ED BY A UNI QUE BI D
NUMBER) MUST BE SUBM TTED | N A SEPARATE ENVELOPE. RESPONSES TO MULTI PLE Bl D NUMBERS SUBM TTED I N
THE SAME ENVELOPE/ COURI ER PACKACGE, THAT ARE NOT | N SEPARATE ENVELOPES PROPERLY | DENTI FI ED, W LL
BE REJECTED. THE DI VI SION OF PURCHASI NG DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSI Bl LI TY FOR LATE BI DS FOR ANY
REASON | NCLUDI NG THOSE DUE TO POSTAL, OR COURI ER SERVI CE. Bl D RESPONSES MJST BE I N THE DI VI SI ON
OF PURCHASI NG OFFI CE PRIOR TO THE "RECEI VE DATE AND TI ME' | NDI CATED ON THE BI D.

3. BID RESPONSES (PAGE 1, PRI CE SHEET AND ADDENDUMS (WHEN SI GNATURE | S RE I RE ? MJST BE I N I NK OR
TYPED ON TH S IVENT.  OR EXACT FORMAT W TH SI GNATURES BEI NG HANDVRI G NALS I N I NK
(PERSON_SI GNI NG BI D, NOTARY, AND NOTARY EXPI RATI , OR THE BID WLL BE REJ ECTED. UNLESS | NDI CATED
IN THE BID, ALL PRI CE PAGES MJUST BE COVPLETED AND RETURNED. | F AN ITEM IS NOT BEI NG BI D, | DENTIFY
IT AS NB (NOBID). PAGES SHOULD BE SECURED. THE DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG DOES NOT ASSUME
RESPONSI Bl LI TY FOR M SSI NG PAGES. FAXED BI D RESPONSES W LL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

4. THE UNIT PRI CE ALWAYS GOVERNS REGARDLESS OF THE EXTENDED AMOUNT. A UNIT PRI CE CHANGE ON A LI NE
MUST BE | NI TI ALED BY THE PERSON SI GNING THE BI D, OR THAT LINE WLL BE REJECTED. THI S | NCLUDES A
CROSS- QUT, STRI KE- OVER, | NK- OVER, WH TE- QUT, ERASURE, OR ANY OTHER METHOD CHANG NG THE PRI CE.

5. A "NO BID' MUST BE RETURNED TO REMAI N ON A CLASS/ SUBCLASS. RETURN PAGE 1 OR NOTI FI CATI ON PAGE
MARKED "NO-BID'. I DENTIFY IT ON THE ENVELOPE AS A "NO-BID'. FAILING TO RESPOND TO 3 ITB'S WTHI N
THE SAME CLASS/ SUBCLASS W LL AUTOVATI CALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/ SUBCLASS. RESPONDI NG
WTH 6 "NO BIDS" WTH N THE SAME CLASS/ SUBCLASS W LL AUTOVATI CALLY PURCE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/
SUBCLASS. A "NO BID' RECEI VED LATE |'S CONSI DERED A NO RESPONSE.

6. THE DI VISION OF PURCHASI NG | S NOT RESPONSI BLE FOR M SI NTERPRETATI ON OF DATA FAXED FROM THI S OFFI CE.

7. THE DI VI SION OF PURCHASI NG REQUI RES AN ORI G NAL AND A M Nl MUM OF ONE COVWPLETE EXACT COPY (TO | NCLUDE
SI GNATURE AND NOTARY) OF THE | NVI TATI ON-TO-BI D RESPONSE. THE ORI GI NAL_AND THE CCOPY SHOULD BE
SUBM TTED TOGETHER AS A BI D PACKAGE. FAI LURE TO MARK RESPONSES AS "ORI G NAL" AND/ OR " COPY" COULD
RESULT I N THE ENTI RE Bl D RESPONSE BEI NG REJECTED.

8. AN | MPROPERLY SUBM TTED BI D, LATE BID, OR BID THAT IS CANCELLED ON OR BEFORE THE OPEN NG DATE W LL
BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS AND THEN DESTROYED. THE BI D MUST BE RETRI EVED DURI NG REGULAR WORK HOURS,
MONDAY - FRI DAY, EXCEPT STATE HOLI DAYS. AFTER THE BI D |'S DESTROYED, THE DI VI SION OF PURCHASI NG
ASSUMES NO RESPONSI BI LI TY FOR THE DOCUNMENT.

DI SQUALI FI EDY CANCELLED BI D

Bl DS THAT ARE | MPROPERLY SUBM TTED OR RECElI VED LATE W LL BE A RESPONSE FOR RECORD, BUT WLL NOT BE
RETURNED OR A NOTI FI CATI ON MAI LED.

THE FOLLON NG | S A PARTI AL LI ST WHEREBY A BI D RESPONSE W LL BE DI SQUALI FI ED:

Bl D NUMBER NOT ON FACE OF ENVELOPE/ COURI ER PACKAGE/ BOX

RESPONSES TO MULTI PLE Bl D NUMBERS | N SAME ENVELOPE NOT PROPERLY | DENTI FI ED

Bl D RECEI VED LATE

Bl D NOT SI GNED/ NOT ORI G NAL SI GNATURE

Bl D NOT NOTARI ZED) NOT ORI G NAL SI GNATURE OF NOTARY AND/ OR NO NOTARY EXPI RATI ON
NOTARI ZED OAN SI GNATURE

REQUI RED | NFORVATI ON NOT SUBM TTED W TH BI D

FAI'LURE TO SUBM T THE ORI G NAL BI D AND A COVPLETE EXACT COPY

CERTI FI CATI ON PURSUANT TO ACT NO. 2006-557

ALABAVA LAW ( SECTI ON 41-4-116, CCDE OF ALABAMA 1975) PROVI DES THAT EVERY BI D SUBM TTED AND CONTRACT
EXECUTED SHALL CONTAI N A CERTI FI CATI ON THAT THE VENDOR CONTRACTOR, AND ALL OF | TS AFFI LI ATES THAT
MAKE SALES FOR DELI VERY | NTO ALABAMA OR LEASES FOR USE | N ALABAMA ARE REG STERED, COLLECTING_ AND
REM TTI NG ALABAVA STATE AND LOCAL SALES, USE, AND/ OR LEASE TAX ON ALL TAXABLE SALES AND LEASES | NTO
ALABAMA. BY SUBM TTING TH' S BI D, THE BI DDER | S HEARBY CERTI FYI NG THAT THEY ARE I N FULL COWVPLI ANCE
W TH ACT NO. 2006-557, THEY ARE NOT BARRED FROM Bl DDI NG OR ENTERI NG | NTO A CONTRACT PURSUANT TO
éﬁlé-Rﬁl_l- jlillgAT'lA('\i?l iAgKl';lgL/\léEDGES THAT THE AWARDI NG AUTHORI TY MAY DECLARE THE CONTRACT VO D | F THE



SPECI AL TERMS & CONDI Tl ONS VENDOR NAME
VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T- NUMBER

. T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

I NTENT TO AWARD

EFFECTI VE MAY 1, 2008, THE STATE OF ALABAMA - DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG
WLL | SSUE AN ' I NTENT TO AWARD BEFORE A FI NAL AWARD | S MADE. THE
"I NTENT TO AWARD W LL CONTI NUE FOR A PERI OD OF FI VE (E)P CALENDAR
DAYS, AFTER WH CH A PURCHASE ORDER W LL BE PRODUCED. ON FI NAL
AWARD, ALL RI GHTS TO PROTEST ARE FORFEI TED. A DETAI LED EXPLANATI ON
OF TH S PROCESS MAY BE REVI EVMED I N THE ALABAMA ADM NI STRATI VE CODE -
CHAPTER 355-4-1(14).

ALTERNATE BI D RESPONSE
UNLESS STATED ELSEWHERE I N THI S | NVI TATION-TO-BI D (1 TB) THE STATE OF
ALABAVA W LL ACCEPT AND EVALUATE ALTERNATE BI D SUBM TTALS ON ANY
ITB'S. ALTERNATE Bl D RESPONSES W LL BE EVALUATED ACCORDI NG TO THE
REQUI REMENTS AS ALL OTHER RESPONSES TO THI S | TB.

I NTERNET VEBSI TE LI NK' S

| NTERNET AND/ OR VEBSI TE LI NKS W LL NOT BE ACCEPTED I N Bl D RESPONSES
,_IA_% él g)EANS TO SUPPLY ANY REQUI REMENTS STATED IN THI S | TB (I NVI TATI O\

PRODUCT DELI VERY, RECEI VI NG AND ACCEPTANCE
I N ACCORDANCE W TH THE UNI VERSAL COMMVERCE CODE ( CODE OF ALABANA,
TI TLE 7), AFTER DELI VERY, THE STATE OF ALABAMA HAS THE RI GHT TO
I NSPECT ALL PRODUCTS BEFORE ACCEPTI NG. THE STATE W LL | NSPECT
PRODUCTS | N A REASONABLE Tl MEFRAMVE.  SI GNATURE ON A DELI VERY DOCUMENT
DOES NOT CONSTI TUTE ACEPTANCE BY THE STATE. THE STATE W LL ACCEPT
PRODUCTS ONLY AFTER SATI SFACTORY | NSPECTI ON.

SALES TAX EXEMPTI ON

PURSUANT TO THE CODE OF ALABAMA, 1975, TITLE 40-23-4 (ég( F\/I%l?' THE
STATE OF ALABANA |S EXEMPT FROM PAYI NG SALES TAX. AN EXEMPTI ON LETTER
W LL BE FURNI SHED UPON REQUEST.

I N\VO CES

I NQUI RI ES CONCERNI NG PAYMENT AFTER | NVO CES HAVE BEEN SUBM TTED ARE
TO BE DI RECTED TO THE RECEI VI NG AGENCY, NOT THE DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG

Bl D RESPONSES AND Bl D RESULTS

UNEVALUATED BI D RESPONSES (NOT BI D RESULTS) ARE AVAI LABLE ON OUR V\EB
SI TE AT WAV PURCHASI NG. ALABAVA. GOV. BI D RESULTS W LL BE MADE AVAI LABLE
FOR REVIEWIN THE DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG CFFI CE, BUT ONLY AFTER THE

Bl D HAS BEEN AWARDED. WE DO NOT FAX OR MAIL COPI ES OF BI D RESULTS.

IF A VENDOR W SHES TO REVI EWBI D RESULTS | N QUR OFFI CE, THEY SHOULD
FAX THEI R REQUEST TO REVI EW THE BI D TWO DAYS | N ADVANCE TO THE "BI D
REVI EW CLERK" AT (334) 242-4419. BE SURE TO REFERENCE THE BI D NUMBER

FOREI GN CORPCRATI ON - CERTI FI CATE OF AUTHORI TY

ALABAMA LAW PROVI DES THAT A FORElI GN CORPORATI ON (AN OUT- OF- STATE
COVMPANY/ FI RM) NMAY NOT TRANSACT BUSI NESS | N THE STATE OF ALABANMA UNTI L
I T OBTAINS A CERTI FI CATE OF AUTHORI TY FROM THE SECRETARY OF STATE.
SECTI ON 10- 2B-15. 01, CODE OF ALABANVA 1975. TO OBTAIN FORMS FOR A
CERTI FI CATE OF AUTHORI TY, CONTACT THE SECRETARY OF STATE, CORPORATI ONS
DI VI SI ON, (334) 242-5324. THE CERTI FI CATE OF AUTHORI TY DCES NOT KEEP
THE VENDOR F SUBM TTI NG A BI D.

Bl D | DENTI FI CATI ON

REFERENCE PACE 2, | TEM 2. DUE TO THE POSTAL SERVI CE PUTTI NG BAR CODE
LABELS ON ENVELOPES, | T CONCEALS THE Bl D NUMBER AND DATE | F THE VENDOR
HAS WRI TTEN THEM OTHER THAN THE LOWER LEFT CORNER, THEREFORE THE BI D
WOULD BE REJECTED FOR NOT BEI NG PROPERLY | DENTI FI ED.



SPECI AL TERMS & CONDI Tl ONS VENDOR NAME
VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T- NUMBER

T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

Rk S b I b Sk R R R S kR Rk kS b ok S R R R Rk kR R IR

PURPCSE:
ESTABLI SH A CONTRACT FROM THE | TEMS LI STED FOR ALL STATE AGENCI ES.
gO\IT RAgT PRI CES ARE AVAI LABLE TO ALL LOCAL GOVERNMENTAL AGENCI ES AND

AWARD:
AWARD WLL BE MADE "ALL OR NONE'" TO THE LOWEST RESPONSI BLE BI DDER
MVEETI NG ALL SPECI FI CATI ONS.

AWARDS:

PRI OR TO MAKI NG AN AWARD, THE STATE RESERVES THE RI GHT TO BENCHVARK
ANY MACHI NE Bl D AGAI NST THE SPECI FI CATI ONS G VEN I N THE SCLI Cl TATI ON.
THE VENDOR HAS TEN (10) DAYS FROM THE DATE OF THE STATE S REQUEST TO
FURNI SH AND | NSTALL T EXACT MACHI NE OFFERED IN THE BID AT A SITE
DES|I GNATED BY THE STATE, THE MACHI NE IS TO REMAI N | NSTALLED AND FULLY
OPERATI ONAL FOR AT LEAST TWOD (2) WEEKS. DURING THI' S TEST PERI OD, THE
VENDOR MUST BE AVAI LABLE (EI THER I N PERSON OR BY PHONE) TO ANSWER ANY
QUESTI ONS THAT MAY ARI SE | N REGARDS TO THE OPERATI ON THE MACHI NE.

FREI GAT:
BID IS F.O B. DESTI NATI ON. ANY FRElI GHT CHARGES MUST BE | NCLUDED I N
THE BI D PRICES. DO NOT | NCLUDE FREI GAT AS A SEPARATE | TEM

CONTRACT PERI OD:

ESTABLI SH A 12 MONTH CONTRACT W TH AN OPTI ON TO EXTEND FOR A SECOND,
THI RD, FOURTH, AND FIFTH 12 MONTH PERI OD W TH THE SAME PRI CI NG TERMS
AND CONDI TIONS.  THE SECOND, THI RD, FOURTH, OR FIFTH 12 MONTH PERI OD,
| F AGREED BY BOTH PARTI ES, WOULD BEG N THE DAY AFTER THE FI RST,
SECOND, THIRD, OR FOURTH 12 MONTH PERI OD EXPI RES. ANY SUCCESSI VE
EXTENSI ON MUST HAVE WRI TTEN APPROVAL OF BOTH THE STATE AND VENDCR NO
Iﬁé-IIR—’Fg:)TMN 30 DAYS PRI OR TO EXPI RATION OF THE PREVI QUS 12 MONTH

NEW EQUI PMENT:
ALL EQUI PMENT MJUST BE NEW AND UNUSED AND ACCEPTABLE BY THE ORI Gl NAL
EQUI PMENT MANUFACTURER FOR THEI R MAI NTENANCE.

MANUFACTURER, STOCK/ MODEL NUMBERS:

AT THE END OF EACH | TEM WHERE SPACES ARE MARKED "MFR' AND "NO.", THE
VENDOR |'S TO | NDI CATE THE MANUFACTURER & ALL STOCK/ MODEL NUMBERS
NECESSARY TO COVPLETE EACH UNI' T AS SPECI FI ED.

DESCRI PTI VE LI TERATURE:
THE BRANDS AND MODEL NUMBERS REFERENCED PROVI DE A LEVEL OF QUALITY,
AND UNLESS OTHERW SE SPECI FI ED, ARE NOT RESTRI CTI VE. VENDCRS Bl DDI NG
ALTERNATE | TEMS MUST PROVI DE_COVMPLETE DESCRI PTI VE/ TECHNI CAL LI TERATURE
FOR CONSI DERATI ON AND EVALUATION WTH THEIR BI D, AND WTH THE BI D COPY
PER | TEM NUMBER 7 ON PAGE 2. REFERENCE TO LI TERATURE W TH A PREVI QUS
BID WLL NOT SATISFY THI S REQUI REMENT. FAI LURE TO PROVI DE THE
REQUI RED LI TERATURE W LL RESULT IN THE REJECTI ON OF THE BI D.

S| CAL | NSPECTI ON AND OPERATI ONAL EVALUATI ON_ MAY ALSO BE
REQUI RED W THOUT COST OR OBLI GATI ON TO THE STATE OF ALABANA.

VENDOR REFERENCES:

VENDOR SHOULD PROVIDE A M Nl MUM OF THREE REFERENCES W TH THEI R BI D.

I NCLUDE COVPANY, ADDRESS, TELEPHONE, CONTACT PERSON AND PERI OD SERVI CE
WAS PERFORVED. W THOUT REFERENCES, A THO?QJGH EVALUATI ON CANNOT  BE
CONDUCTED AND COULD DELAY AWARD COF THE BI D.

VENDOR QUALI FI CATI ON:

| F REQUESTED, VENDOR MJST PROVI DE DOCUVMENTATI ON OF BEI NG AN AUTHCRI ZED
MANUFACTURER S REPRESENTATI VE FOR THE PRODUCTS LI STED. FAI LURE TO
PROVI DE THI' S | NFORVATI ON MAY RESULT I N REJECTI ON CF BI D.



SPECI AL TERMS & CONDI Tl ONS VENDOR NAME
VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T- NUMBER

. T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

REQUESTED | NFORMATI ON:
ANY ADDI TI ONAL | NFORVATI ON REQUESTED FROM A VENDOR MUST BE FURNI SHED
W THI N FI VE (5) DAYS FROM RECElI PT OF REQUEST.

NTI TY:

HE EXACT QUANTITY OF EACH I TEM IS UNKNOWN. THE DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG
DOES NOT GUARANTEE THE STATE WLL BUY ANY AMOUNT. ORDERS W LL BE
PLACED BY AGENCI ES AS NEEDED AND G VE COVPLETE SHI PPI NG | NSTRUCTI ONS.



PRI CE SHEET VENDOR NAME

VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM
LI NE EXTENDED
NO. COVMODI TY/ SERVI CE DESCRI PTI ON QUANTITY UNNT UNIT PRI CE AMOUNT
UNLESS SPECI FI ED OTHERW SE BELOW
SH P TG R1 /
STATEW DE
00001 COVMMODI TY CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

00002

00003

00004

00005

00006

LI VESCAN SYSTEM DESKTOP MODULAR, W TH
ONE (ZI'\.BA YEAR 9/5 ON- S| TE WARRANTY,

CRI M NAL CARD PACKAGES W TH ACCOMPANYI NG
PER THE ATTACHED SPECI FI CATI ONS

MFR: MDL:

CONTACT FOR QUESTI ONS:
LT. TIM PULLIN AT 334-353-0702

Y CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

cowoDl T

LI VESCAN SYSTEM PORTABLE I\/(I)ULAR WTH
ONE (J,\.BA YEAR 9/5 ON-SI TE WARRANT

CRI M NAL CARD PACKACGES W TH ACCO\/PANYI NG
SOFTWARE AND CARRYI NG CASE.

PER THE ATTACHED SPECI FI CATI ONS

MFR: MDL:

TY CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

CaovmvoDI

PRI NTER, DUPLEX FI NGERPRI NT CARD

PRI NTER FOR CRI M NAL & APPLI CANT CARDS
PRI NTER MUST BE FBI CERTI FI ED.

VEBSI TE LI NK PROVI DED I N SPECI FI CATI ONS

MFR: MDL:

TY CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

CaovwoDI

Kl OSK, CABI NET FOR DESKTOP MODULAR
I6IO>)/ESCAN SYSTEM TO BE USED W TH LI NE
PER THE ATTACHED SPECI FI CATI ONS

TY CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

COVMODI

EXTENDED MAI NTENANCE/ SUPPORT FOR THE
DESKTOP OR PORTABLE MODULAR SYSTEM AFTER
THE I NI TI AL ONE YEAR WARRANTY. | NCLUDES
24/ 7 HELP DESK SUPPORT, 9/5 MONDAY THRU
FRI DAY ONSI TE MAI NTENANCE SUPPORT,

REPAI RS OR REPLACEMENT, PARTS AND LABCR
FOR A PERI OD CF ONE Elll YEAR

PER THE ATTACHED SPECI FI CATI ONS

TY CODE: 205-41-079076 1 EA

CavmoDI

EXTENDED MAI NTENANCE/ SUPPORT FOR THE
PRI NTER AFTER THE I NI TI AL ONE YEAR
WARRANTY. | NCLUDES 24/ 7 HELP DESK
SUPPORT, 9/5 MONDAY THRU FRI DAY ONSI TE

PAGE TOTAL




PRI CE SHEET VENDOR NAME
VENDOR NUMBER:

| TB NO. : 10-X- 22150-72 PAGE
I NVI TATION TO BI D OPEN DATE : 12/30/09 TIME 10:00 AM
T- NUMBER

. T710
RETURN DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

EXTENDED
COVMODI TY/ SERVI CE DESCRI PTI ON QUANTITY UNNT UNIT PRI CE AMOUNT

MAI NTENANCE SUPPORT, REPAI RS OR REPLACE-
(I\éE\IET, PARTS AND LABOR FOR A PERI CD OF

%J_.‘E YEAR.
PER ATTACHED SPECI FI CATI ONS

PAGE TOTAL

Bl D TOTAL




Livescan Systems

General Scope of Work

The State of Alabama is soliciting bids to establish a State Contract that can be used by
Local Law Enforcement as a purchasing vehicle to procure desktop modular and
portable live scan systems. These systems must at a minimum meet the biometric
capture requirements for registration of Sex Offenders within the State of Alabama in
compliance with SORNA. These systems may also be used by local Law Enforcement
to process Criminal Offenders as well as local Applicants. The data captured by the live
scan will include demographic information, tenprints, palm prints, and mugshots. The
data will be packaged and sent in a NIST format acceptable to the Department of Public
Safety (DPS), Alabama Bureau of Investigation NEC AFIS system.

Desktop Livescan System

1. The desktop live scan systems must be a turnkey desk top modular system and
include a single scanner that captures tenprint images, upper palm, lower palm,
and writers edge. The turnkey unit must include a high-powered high-speed
desktop computer, 17” flat panel monitor, mouse, keyboard and all associated
cables to make the system fully functional.

Portable Livescan System

1. The portable live scan system must be a turnkey portable system and include a
single scanner that captures tenprint images, upper palm, lower palm, and
writers edge. The turnkey unit must include a portable laptop computer, mouse,
numerical key pad and all associated cables to make the system fully functional.

2. The live scan systems must be lightweight and portable. The system is required
to be available in a configuration capable of transport in a single case by one
person. The system is required to have a case for transport that is made of
hardened plastic and waterproof. The case must secure the live scan system to
prevent damage during routine transport.

GENERAL LIVE SCAN REQUIREMENTS

1. Prices include equipment, delivery and installation including all
software/cards/memory necessary, cables, training, and warranty. All hardware
components and software must be installed and configured before delivery.

2. Bidders must certify that their offered price will remain in effect for the length of
time that the equipment is available and certified on the Federal Bureau of
Investigation (FBI) website. Bidders must certify that their offered price bid is
good for the length of time the equipment is available. As the FBI updates their



list of FBI certified equipment according to the IAFIS Image Quality
Specifications (1QS), Appendix F of the FBI's Electronic Fingerprint
Transmission Specifications or the highest FBI specifications currently
available. The state of Alabama reserves the right to update the contract award
to reflect either new or obsolete equipment. However, the price offered must
remain constant through the life of the contract.

Each livescan station delivered shall be accompanied by a full set of user,
administrator, and technical documentation.

Bidders shall provide three references including name, address, phone number,
title, when the equipment was purchased, and a brief description of the
references’ programs.

Bidders must describe the training programs included with equipment
installation.

Standards Compliance

1.

Compliant with Wavelet Scalar Quantization Grayscale Fingerprint Image
Compression Specifications (IAFIS-1C-010 v3 December 19, 1997).

Compliance with ANSI Data Format for the Interchange of Fingerprint, Facial &
SMT Information (ANSI/NIST-ITL 1-2000).

Certified as compliant to FBI Electronic Fingerprint Transmission Specification
(CJIS-RS-0010 (revision 2004) including Appendix F Image quality specifications
for 500 ppi resolution image capture with and without silicone membrane.

Compliant with FBI NCIC CJIS WAN Protocol Specification and IAFIS
telecommunications standards that specify use of TCP/IP, availability of FTP,
SFTP and X.25 capability. On demand VPN connectivity — single user ID entry.

Compliant with the International Association of Identification (IAl) input to the
FBI's Advisory Policy Board (APB) Identification Services Committee regarding
calibration of livescan systems.

TenPrint / Palm Print / Mugshot Specifications

1.

The live scan systems must include a tenprint and palm scanner suitable for a
law enforcement and/or jail environment. The system must be rugged enough to
withstand use normally expected in this type environment.



2. The palmprint/fingerprint livescan device must capture rolled and flat single
fingers, flat four fingers, flat two thumbs, upper/lower/writer’s (side) palms in an
ANSI/NIST compliant record.

3. The live scan system must ignore moisture in the skin enabling the capture of
clear, high quality prints without having to dry the fingers.

4. The palmprint/fingerprint device must feature a single platen that will scan flats,
rolls, upper and lower palms, and writer’'s palms. It must be a single prism, single
imager, uniform capture area, and does not “stitch” palm images.

5. The live scan system must support roll capture that eliminates tearing, smearing
and smudging of fingerprint images due to movement of the finger on the capture
platen.

6. The live scan system must provide even illumination over the entire platen
surface to ensure the highest quality fingerprints and palm capture at all edges.
Image quality must remain constant regardless of position on the capture platen.

7. The palmprint/fingerprint livescan capture device must be capable of obtaining
clear fingerprint images from fingerprint ridges that are stained by inks, dyes, or
blood or have scars, marks or tattoos.

8. The live scan system must have a single platen to capture tenprints and palm
prints.

9. The live scan system must contain an optics deck with no moving parts to ensure
the highest reliability and the least amount of down-time.

10.The live scan system must come in a sealed, rugged encasement with a high
tolerance for shock and vibration and be completely sealed and impervious to
dust and moisture often encountered in criminal processing environments.

11.The live scan system must provide the operator with real time feedback on the
quality of the fingerprint just captured.

12.The live scan system must incorporate real time sequence checking between the
just rolled fingerprint and the previously rolled slap image thus ensuring the
correct fingerprint was captured.

13.The live scan system must guarantee that the fingerprints and palm prints belong
to the same subject and that the right palm print match the right fingerprints and
left palm print match the left fingerprints.

14.The live scan system must allow the operator to roll fingerprints in either direction
and at the speed the operator desires.



15. The palmprint/fingerprint livescan device must offer variable speed capture, auto
direction, real-time quality assurance checks including correct roll checks.

16.Image quality must comply with FBI specification EFTS Appendix F. Must
operate at 500ppi resolution, have an operating temperature of 35°F to 105° (2°C
to 40°C) and a relative humidity range of 10-90% non-condensing.

17.The palmprint/fingerprint livescan capture device must be factory calibrated and
sealed, with a self test/diagnostics at start-up.

18.The system must provide pull-down menus to provide operator help for data
fields where specific entries are required. Context-based help screens must also
be provided for all major functions of the system.

19. The palmprint/fingerprint livescan system’s capture display must provide true live
display of finger and palm impressions on the connected monitor.

20.The system must provide immediate quality control feedback to the operator on
each individual palmprint and fingerprint image captured.

21.The system shall provide a preview of the palmprint/fingerprint area of the card.
The operator shall have the ability to view a zoomed image and to recapture
prints of insufficient quality, as many times as required to capture a print that will
be acceptable to the system.

22.The system must be capable displaying reject response messages in a format
where a visual acknowledgement is required at the time of the next log in. The
said acknowledgement must be made prior to the next submission. Reject
response messages will be received via SMTP protocol.

23.The live scan system must include a digital photo system that utilizes NIST Best
practice methods to ensure the highest quality photo’s are captured. Photo
systems that do not meet NIST Best practice methods will not be considered
compliant and the vendor will be disqualified.

24.The live scan system must be certified by the State of Alabama to send tenprints,
palm prints, and mugshots based on Alabama Bureau of Investigation NIST
Standards including, but not limited to: CAR, MAP, NFUF and SOR. (attached)

System Administration

1. The system must have remote diagnostic capability.

2. The system must have a security system to prevent unauthorized operator
access. The system shall not allow unauthorized operators to access the

4



3.

4.

equipment. An optional password protection scheme must be used and must not
leave the system in a “logged on” state if the operator leaves the area.

The system must have the capability to direct separate images to predetermined
locations (i.e.: images to DPS and images to printed form).

The system must include a full set of user, administrator, and technical
documentation.

System Printing

1.

The system shall be capable of producing a ten-print applicant card compatible
with DPS and FBI submission requirements.

The palmprint/fingerprint images as well as demographic data must be printed in
appropriate areas of the currently used FBI approved palmprint/fingerprint cards.

The printer bid must come from the FBI certified list which may be obtained at:
http://www.fbibiospecs.org/iafis/default.aspx

AFIS Interface

. The system must be certified to submit to DPS.

The capture station will display the transmission status of completed captures on
the system display. Captured images that cannot be transmitted immediately
must be stored for future transmission.

The system must be capable of transmitting the NIST records to AFIS via a
secure internet connection.

Maintenance Requirements

1.

The livescan bidder must provide Help Desk support 24 hrs a day 7 days a week
for the live scan system.

The bidder shall provide a telephoned response within one hour of the
submission of a reported problem.


http://www.fbibiospecs.org/iafis/default.aspx

The livescan bidder must provide 9/5 Monday through Friday On-Site Support by
trained personnel employed by the vendor (not a third party.) It is a requirement
of the bid that the bidder employ service personnel in the State of Alabama to
minimize downtime and ensure proper service levels are met for the Law
Enforcement Agencies. Bidders proposing service representatives outside the
State of Alabama will be disqualified.

. Each livescan workstation shall include a minimum of one year of hardware and
software warranty and maintenance support services. The warranty shall provide
for all repairs or replacement, including parts and labor for a period of 12 months
from the date of installation and acceptance. Replacement parts will be shipped
within 24 hours of reported problem.

. Extended warranty on Line 00005 and 00006 of the ITB, to be purchased after
the initial one year warranty, shall include all repairs or replacement, including
parts and labor for a period of 12 months. Replacement parts will be shipped
within 24 hours of reported problem.

. The livescan bidder must provide at no cost to ABI a management service which
will report the following information upon written request. The only information to
be reported will be from those livescans which are electronically transmitting.

a. Number of transaction created per agency for a given time period.
b. Type of transaction (CAR, NFUF, MAP, SOR) for a given time period.

. If requested the bidder must provide the name and telephone number of the
service representative for a telephone interview by the State prior to award of the
contract.

. The Service representative must be proficient in written and spoken English.
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lcos

Im

2.022

DATE OF BIRTH

v

2.024

N

51

>

2.022:19800825<GS

8 character field, expressed as YYYYMMDD in which
YYYY must not exceed current date or year, MM must
be a valid menth (01-12),0D must be 01 {0 28,29,30 or
31 depending on month and year.

1) If DOB is equal to 15 vears of age or less the JUV
field must autoset to Y™ anid TAA is omitted.

2} If DOB is equal to or greater than 16 years of age,
and equal to or less than 18 years of age, and ASL field
does not equal statute in Juv Crime Code Table then
JUV is autoset to "Y™ and TAA is omitted.

3) If DOB is equal to or greater than 16 years of age,
and equal to or less than 18 years of age, and ASL field
equals statute in Juv Crime Code Table then JUV is
omitted and TAA is autoset fo "Y™

Juvenile Crime Code Table will be provided.
NOTE: Correct age must be calcuiated by subtracting

DOB from DOA {Include Month, Day and Year in
calridafinn) |

|GENDER

3] |

2.024:M<GS>

Must contain s valid sex code, M= Male, F= Female, X=
Unknown

2.025

JRACE

2.025:W<GS>

Must contain a valid race code. A = Asian Indian,
Japanese, Chinese, Korean, Filipino, Polynesian, Indian,
Indonesian. Samoan or any other Pacific Islander. B =
Black or African American. | = American Indian,
Eskimo, or Alaska Native. U = Indeterminable Race. W
= Caucasian, Mexican, Puerto Rican, Cuban, Central or
South American, or other Spanish

2.026

SCARS, MARKS,
AND TATTOOS

AS

] |

10

10

116

2.026:MISS L
TOERSTAT RF
ARM<GS>

Must be a valid SMT code. Code table will be provided.

2.027

AN

10

2.027 601 <G3>

HGT range = 400 t¢ 711. Unknown = 000

si—
2.029

—Im_m.,I._.
WEIGHT

10

2.029:182<G5>

WGT must be >024 and < 499 to be valid.

2.031

JCOLOR EYES

2.081:BLU<GS>

Must contain 2 valid eye code. BLK =black, BLU=
blug, BRO = brown, GRY = gray, GRN = green, HAZ =
hazel, MAR = maroon, MUL = multicolored, PNK =
pink, Xo0X = unknown

HAI

2.032

HAIR COLOR

[FPA

2.035

10

2.032.BRO<CS>

Must contain a valid hair code. BAL = bald, BLK =
black, BLN = blonde or strawberry, BRC = brown, GRY
= gray of partially gray RED = red or 2ubum, S5DY =
sandy, WHI = white, XXX = unknown, BLU = blue, GRN
= green, ONG = orange, PNK = pink, PLE = purple

2.035.Y <GS>

If not “Y™ then omit

P

2.036

2.036:Y <GS>

¥ not Y™ then omit




LIFHS

dvd JINOH L33
EUWO IO LA, B 3G 1SDING <S0>A0/0'2 3 v | L L Y HOd £SINDITH 0L0°2 0] ¥y
(1a0N) 12A0KW
WI1SAS ONQVY3Y
LINIFJSHIDNA
L o7 L SNY| ONILYNIOTEO Wl
VNG IHVIN
WALSAS ONQVIY
LNESEFONIS
3 <74 3 SNV ONLLYNIDNEO| Wl
U32108 uo Aedsip <SO>GPECE {13l ONISS300dd
JOU O "PamO]|e S| IBJ02IBYS HSIR Kg-) BIgeluLd AUY]SNPEL LSNIBA L9002 601 0 JOVII 1907 O <2|__
<SO>SNOHIDNVA SENIWNGD
"PAMOI[E S JSIOEIEYD USO. UG-/ Sigeluld Auy] aNY 0IWHYI950'Z LS| 0 06 3 NY| NOILYDIFIINIOl gsoz) o) oo
fuessasau
#7185V AlLe(0 0} pash 8q pIN0YS piaY 4O uood 1xa)
a4 "3|qe) dnyoe| Woy paiddns si pley Jo uoed 1Swe
(1av Aq papinoid 151 TSV PUB S2pC3 DIJN)YSEP
ay) Buwmoj|o) 2oeds ON “1SV SMO|I0} USEP ¥ (Z) ISV
PUE 3P0 DION Uaamiaq 20eds ou sy alsy m.n 1 :310N
3349034 181 = 1X31 3344
(a1ep
159Ky Jo ale(] asn
-JADINOH = 1SY 8igErRAR 10U O0Q JI)
(ooa}
$660=3002 1IN 0 8 b | NJ 3SN3340 40 31va LY
¥OQ 0l =10 > &g Isnwz 0Og
“leaf pLe Lpuoil Ue Bupuadap e 0 OF '6Z ‘g7 01 LD 9q
1N QgyzZL-10) YILowW plea 90 ISNW WA ~Jeak 20 2iep
JUB.UND PISOXS JOU ISNW AAAA UdIUM UL "QANIWAAAA | <SD>SWHYIHIZ-H0
Se passaldxs PRy BRIy g - SLEOYE6L - 00| NOISS3ISSOdZles
SNOZ6Y
661 <SH>3TdD3Aa
1S1-30IDINQHE660 EX3 L 33934
<SO>1X3} IFTHI-ISVYIIN<SN=00QF0Z] SNSL60FE6L:LF0E) Q0¥ L 1 SNV INIJNOFS 1STHHY LP0'Z E ISV
1vQsoL piy | odl =10 9qisnpy  Jesh pus
Lluows uo Buipusdsp Lg Jo OE 62 '8Z OF L0 &g isnW QQ
(Z1-0} HIUOW pifeA 3G ISNLU WW "31EP JUBLINS > 10 = 3q
ISNW 23B(] ESA JO 2UED JUDUNT PIDIXD JOU 1SN AAAA
YAIUM U QAWNINLAAAA $2 Passaldxs pay Jeoeseys g <
SO>YZ60r66L-6r0C Sl L 2] ) Nj__LS3uMy 40 31va) 404 k! ] yodqi
<S9>HO
‘SNanNIoD T3 LNRIdSTONIS
‘PaMO|[E J0U S1 IX2) USamaq sisjeeleyd adeds AAIET JvT ‘NOSHad
S|dlingy "pamojje SI 1SI0BI2Y2 1SIE Ng-2 Bigesund Auy HYO 206 _&o.w_ 21 0 0Z1 1 SNV d0 JONIAISIY L¥Q'2 Of S3H
<5
"PAMO]|E S1 JSIOBIBYS ISOE 11G-/ 1B AUY] D>HIFNN T 0F0'T LG m— G } SNY! NOLLYJNI230 0r0'g! 0 420
<SO>AN
'0vadNg I1dYIW
228 "ANYdNQD
"Pamoj|e Jou S| X3} Lasmiaq sisoeleld aseds]  NQILONHLSNOD, S53AXAAav!
B|diny "pemo|[e S| ISI0RIBLD 11822 UG-/ JiqBluud Auy ADY6E0E Z1 0 ozl SNY| ANV HIAO 1N 620 O av3a]




CRI M 2,073 CONTROLLING AN 1 I 1 3 36 _m.oai_.»m.acaA
GS>
The ORI must be valid.
AMP C2 2,064 Io 9 E3 Z.084:03<US>XX<R
S>09<US>UP<FS>
M N 2 2 1 1
(FGP)
M AMPUTATED OR  {A 2 2 1 1
BANDAGED CODE
— AMPCD) : — e
TAA 03 2.087 Treat as Adult A 1 1 _o 1 _m 2.087 Y<GS> J._,“ not Y” then ormit Reference DOB field 2.022
JUV 03 2.800 JUVENILE A 1 1 0 1 3 2.600; Y<GS> £ ot Y~ then omit Reference DOB field 2.022
SUBMISSION :
Notes:

1. The DPOO portion of this field is mandatory. f DOO is not known use DOA (Date of Arrest) date.
2. This field is mandatory if any finger is either amputated or rolled impression was not made.
3. IFTAA ="Y"then JUV field must be omitted. if JUV = "Y" then TAA field must be omitter

Record Types required: Type 1, Type 2, Type 4
Under the Condition column: G = Optional; M = Mandatory; C = Conditional, see notes
Under the Character type column: A = Alphabetic; N = Numeric; S = Special characters, see notes
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DOB Jm 2022 JoATEOFBIRTH N Ie 8 1 Is 51 2.022:19800825<G |8 character field, expressed as YYYYMMDD in which
S> YYYY must not exceed current date or year. MM must be
a valid month (01-12);0D must be 01 to 28,28,30 or 31
depending on month and year.
_w._.m|x M 2.024 GENDER A 1 1 1 1 8 2.024:M<GS> Must contain a valid sex code. M= Male, F= Female, X=
Unknown . ‘
JRAC M 2.025 RACE A 1 1 1 1 .nm 2.025:W<GS> Must contain a valid race code. A = Asian Indian,
Japanese, Chinese, Karean, Filipino, Polynesian, Indian,
Indonesian. Samoan or any other Pacific Islander. B =
Black or African American. ! = American Indian, Eskimo,
or Alaska Native. U = Indeterminable Race. W=-
Caucasian, Mexican, Puerto Rican, Cuban, Central or
[South American, or other Spanish
p—— — o ———
SMT 18] 2.026 SCARS, MARKS, AS 3 10 [¥] 10 116 2.026:MISS L {Must be a valid SMT code. Code table will be provided.
AND TATTOOS TOERSTAT RF
- ARM<GS>
[FGT W 2027 HEIGHT AN 3 3 0 1 10 2.027601<G5>  |HGT range = 400 to 711, Unknown = 000
WGT Im 2.029 TWEGHT ™ 3 5 T T 10 2.029:182<G5>
'WGT must be >024 and < 499 to be vaiid.
EYE M -m.om._ COLOR m<mm A 2 3 1 1 10 2.031:BLU<GS>  IMust contain a valid eye code. BLK = black, BLU = biue,
BRO = brown, GRY = gray, GRN = green, HAZ = hazel,
MAR = maroon, MUL = multicolored, PNK = pink, X00(
= unknown
HAI [ [ 2.032 _Ib_m COLOR A -m 3 1 1 10 M,owm“mmOAmmv
Must contain 2 valid hair code. BAL = bald, BLK = black,
BLN = blonde or strawberry, BRO = brown, GRY = gray
or partially gray RED = red or auburn, SDY = sandy, WHI
= white, JOO( = unknown, BLU = blue, GRN = green,
ONG = orange, PNK = pink, PLE = purple
RFP M 2.037 REASON ANS T 75 T 1 52 2.037:CONSIDERI |Commas, bianks, dashes, hyphens and slashes are alt
FINGERPRINTED NG FOR allowed as special characters.
EMPLOYMENT
<GS
IoPR I~ 2.038 BATEPRNTED I 3 2 T 1 5 2.038:19940024<G [8 character field, expressed as YYYYMMDD i which
S> YYYY must not exceed current date or year. MM must be
a valid month (01-12);DD must be 01 to 28,29,30 or 31
i r
[EAD @] 039 EMPLOYERAND _ JANS 1 120 0 1 127 2 039-ACE Any printable 7-bit acsii character is allowed. Muliple
ADDRESS CONSTRUCTION |space characters between text is not allowed.
COMPANY, 327
MAPLE AVE,
BUFFALQ,
[oce 0 2.040 OCCUPATION — |ANS 1 50 o 7 57 2.040:PLUMBERS< JAny printable 7-bit acsii character is allowed.
. G5>
RES 0 2041 RESIDENCE OF  JANS T 120 o T 127 2.041:5021 OAK _ JAny printable 7-bit acst charactes 1s allowed, Mufiple
PERSON space characters between text is not allowed.
FINGERPRINTED
[ e 2.067 IMAGE CAPTURE 10 1 109 2.067:DBI US 1134 JAny prirtable 7-bit acsii character is aliowed. Do not
EQUIPMENT US12345<GS> display on screen
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SEX M 2.024 GENDER A 1 1 1 1 & 2.024:M<GS>
Must contain a valid sex code. M= Male, F= Female, X= Unknown
wao I 2.025 RACE A 1 1 1 1 8 2.025:W<GS5> Must contain a valid race code. A = Asian Indian, Japanese,
Chinese, Korean, Fifiping, Polynesian, indian, Indonesian. Samoan
or any cther Pacific Islander. B = Black or African American. i =
American Indian, Eskimo, or Alaska Mative. U = indeterminable
Race. W = Caucasian, Mexican, Puerto Rican, Cuban, Central or
South American, or other Spanish
[SMT [e] 2.026 SCARS, MARKS, AS 3 10 Io 10 118 2.026:MISS L Must be a valid SMT code. Code table will be provided.
AND TATTOOS TOERSTAT RF
HGT q?._ 2.027 JREGHT %bz 3 3 1 1 10 2.027:601<GS> HGT range = 400 to 711. Unknown = 000
WGT —.z_ 2.029 WEIGHT N g 3 1 1 10 2.029:1B2<GS>  JWGT must be >024 and < 499 o be valid.
EYE M 2.031 COLOR EYES A 3 3 1 1 10 2.031:BLU<GS>
Must contain a valid eye code. BLK = black, BLU = blue, BRO =
brown, GRY = gray, GRN = green, HAZ = hazel, MAR = maroon,
MUL = multicolored, PNK = pink, X0{X = unknown
fHAl M 2.032 HAIR COLOR A 3 3 1 1 10 2 032BRO<GS>  JMUSt contain a valid hair code. BAL = bald, BLK = black, BLN =
blonde or strawberry, BRQ = brown, GRY = gray or partially gray
RED = red or aubum, SDY = sandy, WHI = white, XXX = unknown,
BLU = blue, GRN = green, ONG = crange, PNK = pink, PLE =
purple
IrFP M 2.037 REASON ANS 1 I75 1 1 | = 2.037:CONSIDERI J[Commas, blanks, dashes, hyphens and slashes are all allowed as
FINGERPRINTED NG FOR special characters.
EMPLOYMENT ’
<G5>
DPR M 2.038 DATE PRINTED N 18 8 1 t 15 2.038:19940924<G
EAD o] 2,039 EMPLOYERAND . JANS T 120 0 1 127 ANy printable 7-bi acsi character is allowed. MUliple space
ADDRESS characters between text is not allowed.
OCP Q 2.040 OCCUPATION ~JANS 1 50 0 1 57 2.040:PLUMBER< JAny printable 7-bit acsii character is allowed.
GS>
RES 0 2.041 ANS 1 120 I T 127 2.041:5021 OAK _ JAny printable 7-bit acsil character is alowed.
LEAF DRIVE,
FINGERPRINTED COLUMBUS,
s Q<G5>
TSR [e] 2.043 TYPE OF SEARCH JA 1 1 jo 1 8 2.043:V <GS> Do not display on screen
REQUESTED
R [e] 2.067 IMAGE CAPTURE | 1 109 2.067-DBI US 1134 _>3.. printable -t aosil character is aflowed. Do not gisplay on
‘ EQUIPMENT US12345<GS> screen
M ORIGINATING ANS 1 25 1 1
FINGERPRINT
READING SYSTEM
MAKE (MAK)
M ORIGINATING ANS 1 25 1 1
FINGERPRINT
READING SYSTEM
MODEL {MODL)
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TABLE 5 -- FIELD LIST FOR TYPE-15 (CRIMINAL PALM) LOGICAL RECORDS
IDENTIFIERJCONDITION JFELD NUMBER FIELD NAME CHARACTER|] FIELD SIZE JOGCURRENGE| WAXIMUM 1
) TYPE PER S NUMBER OF
OCCURRENCE BYTES
INCLUDI
MIN. IMAX.] MiIN. JMAX. C: Alr:!liC'?gR
SEPARATORS
AND FIELD
|LEN M 15.001 LOGICAL RECORD LENGTH N 8 1 1 15
|IDC M 15.002 IMAGE DESIGNATION CHARACT N 1 i 12
IMP M 15.003 IMPRESSION TYPE N 2 2 1 1 9
SRC M 15.004 SOURCE AGENCY / ORI AN 10 36 1 1 43
PCD M 15.005 PALMPRINT CAPTURE DATE N 9 9 1 1 16
HLL M 15.006 HORIZONTAL LINE LENGTH N 4 5 1 1 i2
VLL M 15.007 |VERTICAL LINE LENGTH N 4 5 1 1 i2
SLC |M 15.008 SCALE UNITS N 2 2 1 1 g
HPS JM 15.009 HORIZONTAL PIXEL SCALE N 2 5 1 1 12
VPS IM 15.010 VERTICAL PIXEL SCALE N 2 5 1 1 12
CGA |M 15.011 COMPRESSION ALGORITHM AN 4 6 1 1 14
BPX |M 15.012 BITS PER PIXEL N 2 3 1 1 10
PLP lM 15.013 PALMPRINT POSITION N 3 3 1 1 10
RSV 15.014-15.015 {RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
SHPS e} 15.016 SCANNED HORIZONTAL PIXEL § N 2 5 0 1 12
SVPS O 15.017 SCANNED VERTICAL PIXEL SCA N 5 0 1 12
RSV 15.018-15.019 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - = - - -- -
COM 0 15.020 COMMENT AN 2 128 0 1 135
RSV 15.021-15.023 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
PQM o' 15.024 PALMPRINT QUALITY METRIC N 13 38 0 4 159
RSV 15.025-15.020 JRESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
DMM 0 15,030 DEVICE MONITORING MODE A 8 11 0 1 18
RSV 15.031-16.199 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
UDF O 15.200-15.998 |USER-DEFINED FIELDS -- - - - -- -
DATA M 15,900 IMAGE DATA B 2 - 1 1 -
Notes: 1. See table below for field 15.024
Palm Position|Palm Code Width Height
{mm) {in) {mm) | {in}
rUnknown
Palm 20.000 139.7 5.5 203.2 8
Right Full
IEilm 21.000 139.7 8.5 203.2 8
Right Writer
Paim 22,000 44.5 1.8 127 5
Left Full
Balm 23.000 139.7 55 203.2 8
Left Writer
Palm 24.000 44.5 1.8 127 5
Right Lower
Palm 25.000 139.7 5.5 1387 | 5.5
Right Upper
Palm 26.000 139.7 5.5 139.7 | 55
Left Lower
Palm 27.000 139.7 5.5 130.7 5.5
Left Upper
Palm 28,000 139.7 5.5 139.7 5.6
Right Other 28.000 139.7 5.5 203.2 8




Left Other 30.000 139.7 5.5 203.2 8
Right
I|n1erdigita| 31.000 139.7 5.5 76.2 3
Right Thenar] 35 gpg 76.2 3 1143 | 45
Right

Hypothenar 33.000 76.2 3 1143 | 45
Left
linterdigital 34.000 130.7 5.5 76.2 3
Left Thenar 35.000 76.2 3 i14.3 4.5
Left

Hypothenar 36.000 76.2 3 i14.3 4.5
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TABLE 5 -- FIELD LIST FOR TYPE-15 (CRIMINAL PALM) LOGICAL RECORDS

IDENTIFIERJCONDITION JFIELD NUMBER FIELD NAME CHARACTER] FIELD SIZE JOCCURRENCE] MAXIMUM
TYPE PER 5 NUMBER OF
DCCURRENCE BYTES
MIN. [MAX.] MIN. |MAX] |NCLUDING
CHARACTER
SEPARATORS
LEN M 16.001 LOGICAL RECORD LENGTH N 4 1 1 15
IDC M 15.002 IMAGE DESIGNATION CHARACT N 1 1 12
IMP M 15.003 IMPRESSION TYPE N 2 2 1 1 2]
SRC M 15.004 SOURCE AGENCY / ORI AN 10 36 1 1 43
PCD M 15.006 PALMPRINT CAPTURE DATE N 9 9 1 1 16
HLL M 15.008 HORIZONTAL LINE LENGTH N 4 & 1 1 12
VLL M 15.007 VERTICAL LINE LENGTH N 4 5 1 1 12
SLC M 15,008 SCALE UNITS N 2 2 1 1 9
HPS M 15.009 HORIZONTAL PIXEL SCALE N 2 5 1 1 12
VP3 M 16.010 VERTICAL PIXEL SCALE N 2 5 1 1 12
CGA M 15.011 COMPRESSION ALGORITHM AN 4 B 1 1 14
BPX M 15.012 !BITS PER PIXEL N 2 3 1 1 10
PLP M 16.013 |PALMPRINT POSITION N 3 3 1 1 10
RSV 15.014-15.015 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - -- - -
SHPS o] 15.016 SCANNED HORIZONTAL PIXEL S N 2 5 0 1 12
SVPS (o] 15017 SCANNED VERTICAL PIXEL SCA N 2 0 1 12
RSV 15.018-15.019 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - . & - - -
COM 8] 15,020 COMMENT AN 2 128 0 1 135
RSV 16.021-16.023 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - --
PQM o’ 15.024 PALMPRINT QUALITY METRIC N 13 38 0 4 1569
RSV 156.026-15.020 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
DMM [o] 15.030 DEVICE MONITORING MODE A 8 11 0 1 18
RSV 15.031-15.199 |RESERVED FOR FUTURE DEFIN - - - - - -
UDF 0 15.200-15.998 |USER-DEFINED FIELDS - - -- - - T
DATA M 15.999 IMAGE DATA B 2 - 1 1 -
Notes: 1. Ses table below for field 15.024
Palm PositionfPaim Code Width Height
(mm) (in) {mm) | (in}
Unknown
Paim 20,000 139.7 55 203.2 8
Right Full
| Patm 21.000 139.7 5.5 203.2 8
Right Writer
Patm 22.000 44.5 1.8 127 5
Left Fult
Palm 23.000 139.7 5.6 2032 | 8
Left Writer
Palm 24.000 44.5 1.8 127 5
Right Lower
| Palm 25.000 139.7 5.5 139.7 5.5
Right Upper
Palm 26.000 139.7 55 1207 | 5.5
Left Lower
Patm 27.000 139.7 5.5 130.7 | 6.5
Leit Upper
Palm 28.000 130.7 55 130.7 | 55
Right Qther 29.000 139.7 55 203.2 8




Left Other

30.000 130.7 5.5 203.2 8
Right
Interdigital 31.000 139.7 5.5 76.2 3
Right Thenar| 35 gog 76.2 3 1143 | 45
Right
Hypothenar 33.000 768.2 3 114.3 4.5
Left
Interdigital 34.000 138.7 5.5 76.2 3
Left Thenar 35.000 76.2 3 114.3 4.5
Left
Hypothenar 36.000 76.2 3 114.3 4.5




I NVI TATION TO BID NO 2215072 ADDENDUM NO: 01

STATE OF ALABANA

DEPTARTMENT OF FI NANCE REQ AGENCY © 999999

DI VI SI ON OF PURCHASI NG PURCHASI NG DI VI SI ON
AGENCY REQ NO : AG
T- NUMBER : T710
DATE | SSUED : 12/17/09

I NVI TATI ON TO Bl D ADDENDUM VENDOR NO. :
VENDOR PHONE NO. :
SNAP REQ. NO. © 1433472
BUYER NANME : JENNI FER LORETZ
FOR: FI NGERPRI NT SCANNI NG EQUI P BUYER PHONE NO. © (334) 242-7370

Bl D MUST BE RECEI VED BEFCRE:
DATE: 12/29/09 TIME 5:00 PM

BIDS WLL BE PUBLI CLY OPENED:
DATE: 12/30/09 TIME  10:00 AM

PLEASE READ ALL | NSTRUCTI ONS CAREFULLY

THE FOLLOW NG CHANGES ARE HEREBY ADDED TO AND MADE A PART OF
(' NVI TATI ON TO BI D NUMBER 2215072 )

THE PURPOSE OF THI'S ADDENDUM | S TO | NCLUDE THE NI ST SPECI FI CATI ONS FOR
THE SEX OFFENDER REG STRATION.  (TI TLED ADDO1SORNI ST. PDF)

THE BI D RETURN AND Bl D OPEN DATES REMAI N THE SAME.

* % * *x * % % *x *x * % * *x * % * END O: Au:)ENwM * % % * *x * % * * *x * % * *x * *

STATEMENT OF UNDERSTANDI NG

|  UNDERSTAND THE ADDENDUM AND THAT | T MUST BE SI GNED I N | NK AND RETURNED
UNLESS | NDI CATED OTHERW SE) W TH THE BI D OR SEPARATELY, PROPERLY | DENTI FI ED AND
ECEI VED PRI OR TO DATE AND TI ME SPECI FI ED.

COVPANY NAME AUTHORI ZED ST GNATURE (TNK)
ADDENDUM NOTARI ZATI ON
NOT REQUI RED MATL ADDRESS TYPE PRI'NT AUTHORI ZED NAVE
Ty, STATE, ZITP




