
                                                  INVITATION TO BID NO:  09-R-2208821
                      
                      STATE OF ALABAMA
 
                   DEPTARTMENT OF FINANCE         REQ. AGENCY        : 017000
                   DIVISION OF PURCHASING                             PUBLIC SAFETY
                                                  AGENCY REQ. NO.    : 946926
                                                  T-NUMBER           :
                                                  DATE ISSUED        : 07/23/09
                     INVITATION TO BID            VENDOR NO.         :
                                                  VENDOR PHONE NO.   :
                                                  SNAP REQ. NO.      : 1420807
                                                  BUYER NAME         : RAY BRESSLER
                      
 FOR:    INTEGRA ID UPGRADE LEASE PURCHASE        BUYER PHONE NO.    : (334) 242-4670-
         ABI / LATENT PRINT                       PURCHASING PHONE NO: (334) 242-7250
 
                                                   BID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:
                                                   DATE:  08/13/09  TIME:  5:00  PM
 
                                                   BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
                                                   DATE:  08/14/09  TIME:  10:00 AM
 
                         TO BE COMPLETED BY VENDOR
 
  INFORMATION IN THIS SECTION SHOULD BE PROVIDED, AS APPROPRIATE.  BID RESPONSE
  MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED WITH ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION.
 
 1. DELIVERY: CAN BE MADE _________ DAYS OR _________ WEEKS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER
 
 2. TERMS: ________________(DISCOUNTS ARE TAKEN WITHOUT REGARD TO DATE OF PAYMENT.)
 
 3. PRICE VALID FOR ACCEPTANCE WITHIN ____________ DAYS.
 
 4. VENDOR QUOTATION REFERENCE NUMBER, IF ANY: ______________
    (THIS NUMBER WILL APPEAR ON THE PURCHASE ORDER.)
 
 5. E-MAIL ADDRESS: ______________________________________________________
 
    INTERNET WEBSITE:  ___________________________________________________
 
 6. GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO: _____________________________________
 
    TYPE OF G.C. LICENSE: ________________________________________________
 
     RETURN INVITATION TO BID:
 
                   US MAIL                                  COURIER
            _____________________                    _____________________
 
            STATE OF ALABAMA                         STATE OF ALABAMA
            DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE                    DIVISION OF PURCHASING
            DIVISION OF PURCHASING                   RSA UNION BUILDING
            P O BOX 302620                           100 N. UNION ST., SUITE 192
            MONTGOMERY, AL 36130-2620                MONTGOMERY, AL 36104
 
                             ***** IMPORTANT NOTE: *****
    BIDDERS MUST COMPLY WITH ALL "BID RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS" ON PAGE 2, TO INCLUDE
    ITEM 7 - COPY REQUIREMENT.
 
                         SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION REQUIRED
 I HAVE READ THE ENTIRE BID AND AGREE TO FURNISH EACH ITEM OFFERED AT THE PRICE QUOTED.
 I HERBY AFFIRM I HAVE NOT BEEN IN ANY AGREEMENT OR COLLUSION AMONG BIDDERS IN
 RESTRAINT OF FREEDOM OF COMPETITION BY AGREEMENT TO BID AT A FIXED PRICE OR TO
 REFRAIN FROM BIDDING.
 
 
 SWORN TO AND                  _________________________     _________________________
                               FEIN OR SSN                   AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (INK)
 
 SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME THIS     _________________________     _________________________
                               COMPANY NAME                  TYPE/PRINT AUTHORIZED NAME
 
 ______ DAY OF ___________     _________________________     _________________________
                               MAIL ADDRESS                  TITLE
 
 _________________________     _________________________     _________________________
 NOTARY PUBLIC                 CITY, STATE, ZIP              TOLL FREE NUMBER
 
 TERM EXP: _______________     _________________________     _________________________
                               PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE     FAX NUMBER
 



   STANDARD TERMS & CONDITIONS                VENDOR NAME  :
                      
                                              VENDOR NUMBER:          -
                                              ITB NO.    :  09-R-2208821                PAGE   2
   INVITATION TO BID                          OPEN DATE  :  08/14/09  TIME: 10:00 AM
 
                                              RETURN DATE:  08/13/09  TIME: 5:00  PM
 
   AUTHORITY:
       THE DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE CODE OF ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE, CHAPTER  355-4-1 EFFECTIVE
       DECEMBER 20, 2001 IS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE AND MADE A PART OF T HIS DOCUMENT.  TO RECEIVE A
       COPY CALL (334)242-7250, OR OUR WEBSITE  WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV .
 
   INFORMATION AND ASSISTANCE TO MINORITY BUSINESSES IN THE TECHNICAL COMPLETION OF REQUIRED FORMS MAY BE
   OBTAINED FROM THE OFFICE OF MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE, 1-800-447-4191.
 
                        BID (ITB) RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS                 REV: 04/07/09
 
   1.  TO SUBMIT A RESPONSIVE BID, READ THESE INSTRUCTIONS, ALL TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS.
 
   2.  BID ENVELOPES/PACKAGES/BOXES MUST BE IDENTIFIED ON FRONT, PREFERABLY LOWER LEFT CORNER AND BE
       VISIBLE WITH THE BID NUMBER AND OPENING DATE.  EACH INDIVIDUAL BID (IDENTIFIED BY A UNIQUE BID
       NUMBER) MUST BE SUBMITTED IN A SEPERATE ENVELOPE.  RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS SUBMITTED IN
       THE SAME ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE, THAT ARE NOT IN SEPARATE ENVELOPES PROPERLY IDENTIFIED, WILL
       BE REJECTED.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR LATE BIDS FOR ANY
       REASON INCLUDING THOSE DUE TO POSTAL, OR COURIER SERVICE.  BID RESPONSES MUST BE IN THE DIVISION
       OF PURCHASING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE "RECEIVE DATE AND TIME" INDICATED ON THE BID.
 
   3.  BID RESPONSES (PAGE 1, PRICE SHEET AND ADDENDUMS (WHEN SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED)) MUST BE IN INK OR
       TYPED ON THIS DOCUMENT.  OR EXACT FORMAT WITH SIGNATURES BEING HANDWRITTEN ORIGINALS IN INK
       (PERSON SIGNING BID, NOTARY, AND NOTARY EXPIRATION), OR THE BID WILL BE REJECTED.  UNLESS INDICATED
       IN THE BID, ALL PRICE PAGES MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED.  IF AN ITEM IS NOT BEING BID, IDENTIFY
       IT AS NB (NO-BID).  PAGES SHOULD BE SECURED.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME
       RESPONSIBILITY FOR MISSING PAGES.  FAXED BID RESPONSES WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.
 
   4.  THE UNIT PRICE ALWAYS GOVERNS REGARDLESS OF THE EXTENDED AMOUNT. A UNIT PRICE CHANGE ON A LINE
       MUST BE INITIALED BY THE PERSON SIGNING THE BID, OR THAT LINE WILL BE REJECTED.  THIS INCLUDES A
       CROSS-OUT, STRIKE-OVER, INK-OVER, WHITE-OUT, ERASURE, OR ANY OTHER METHOD CHANGING THE PRICE.
 
   5.  A "NO BID" MUST BE RETURNED TO REMAIN ON A CLASS/SUBCLASS.  RETURN PAGE 1 MARKED "NO-BID".
       IDENTIFY IT ON THE ENVELOPE AS A "NO-BID".  FAILING TO RESPOND TO 3 ITB'S WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/
       SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS.  RESPONDING WITH 6
       "NO-BIDS" WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/
       SUBCLASS.  A "NO-BID" RECEIVED LATE IS CONSIDERED A NO RESPONSE.
 
   6.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING IS NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR MISINTERPRETATION OF DATA FAXED FROM THIS OFFICE.
 
   7.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING REQUIRES AN ORIGINAL AND A MINIMUM OF ONE COMPLETE EXACT COPY (TO INCLUDE
       SIGNATURE AND NOTARY) OF THE INVITATION-TO-BID RESPONSE. THE ORIGINAL AND THE COPY SHOULD BE
       SUBMITTED TOGETHER AS A BID PACKAGE.
 
   8.  AN IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED BID, LATE BID, OR BID THAT IS CANCELLED ON OR BEFORE THE OPENING DATE WILL
       BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS AND THEN DESTROYED. THE BID MUST BE RETRIEVED DURUIG REGULAR WORK HOURS,
       MONDAY - FRIDAY, EXCEPT STATE HOLIDAYS. AFTER THE BID IS DESTROYED, THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING
       ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY FOR THE DOCUMENT.
 
                                         DISQUALIFIED/CANCELLED BID
 
   BIDS THAT ARE IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED OR RECEIVED LATE WILL BE A RESPONSE FOR RECORD, BUT WILL NOT BE
   RETURNED OR A NOTIFICATION MAILED.
 
   THE FOLLOWING IS A PARTIAL LIST WHEREBY A BID RESPONSE WILL BE DISQUALIFIED:
 
      BID NUMBER NOT ON FACE OF ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE/BOX
      RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS IN SAME ENVELOPE NOT PROPERLY IDENTIFIED
      BID RECEIVED LATE
      BID NOT SIGNED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE
      BID NOT NOTARIZED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE OF NOTARY AND/OR NO NOTARY EXPIRATION
      NOTARIZED OWN SIGNATURE
      REQUIRED INFORMATION NOT SUBMITTED WITH BID
      FAILURE TO SUBMIT THE ORIGINAL BID AND A COMPLETE EXACT COPY WILL RESULT IN REJECTION OF THE BID
      RESPONSE
      FAILURE TO MARK RESPONSES AS "ORIGINAL" AND/OR "COPY" COULD RESULT IN THE ENTIRE BID RESPONSE BEING
      REJECTED
 
                               CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO ACT NO. 2006-557
 
   ALABAMA LAW (SECTION 41-4-116,CODE OF ALABAMA 1975) PROVIDES THAT EVERY BID SUBMITTED AND CONTRACT
   EXECUTED SHALL CONTAIN A CERTIFICATION THAT THE VENDOR, CONTRACTOR, AND ALL OF ITS AFFILIATES THAT
   MAKE SALES FOR DELIVERY INTO ALABAMA OR LEASES FOR USE IN ALABAMA ARE REGISTERED, COLLECTING, AND
   REMITTING ALABAMA STATE AND LOCAL SALES, USE, AND/OR LEASE TAX ON ALL TAXABLE SALES AND LEASES INTO
   ALABAMA.  BY SUBMITTING THIS BID, THE BIDDER IS HEARBY CERTIFYING THAT THEY ARE IN FULL COMPLIANCE
   WITH ACT NO. 2006-557, THEY ARE NOT BARRED FROM BIDDING OR ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT PURSUANT TO
   41-4-116, AND ACKNOWLEDGES THAT THE AWARDING AUTHORITY MAY DECLARE THE CONTRACT VOID IF THE
   CERTIFICATION IS FALSE.
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                                INTENT TO AWARD
 
     EFFECTIVE MAY 1, 2008, THE STATE OF ALABAMA - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
     WILL ISSUE AN 'INTENT TO AWARD' BEFORE A FINAL AWARD IS MADE.  THE
     'INTENT TO AWARD' WILL CONTINUE FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) CALENDAR
     DAYS, AFTER WHICH A PURCHASE ORDER WILL BE PRODUCED.  UPON FINAL
     AWARD, ALL RIGHTS TO PROTEST ARE FORFEITED.  A DETAILED EXPLANATION
     OF THIS PROCESS MAY BE REVIEWED IN THE ALABAMA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE -
     CHAPTER 355-4-1(14).
 
                              ALTERNATE BID RESPONSE
     UNLESS STATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS INVITATION-TO-BID (ITB) THE STATE OF
     ALABAMA WILL ACCEPT AND EVALUATE ALTERNATE BID SUBMITTALS ON ANY
     ITB'S.  ALTERNATE BID RESPONSES WILL BE EVALUATED ACCORDING TO THE
     REQUIREMENTS AS ALL OTHER RESPONSES TO THIS ITB.
 
                            INTERNET WEBSITE LINK'S
 
     INTERNET AND/OR WEBSITE LINKS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED IN BID RESPONSES
     AS A MEANS TO SUPPLY ANY REQUIREMENTS STATED IN THIS ITB (INVITATION-
     TO-BID).
 
                PRODUCT DELIVERY, RECEIVING AND ACCEPTANCE
     IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UNIVERSAL COMMERCE CODE (CODE OF ALABAMA,
     TITLE 7), AFTER DELIVERY, THE STATE OF ALABAMA HAS THE RIGHT TO
     INSPECT ALL PRODUCTS BEFORE ACCEPTING.  THE STATE WILL INSPECT
     PRODUCTS IN A REASONABLE TIMEFRAME.  SIGNATURE ON A DELIVERY DOCUMENT
     DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACEPTANCE BY THE STATE.  THE STATE WILL ACCEPT
     PRODUCTS ONLY AFTER SATISFACTORY INSPECTION.
 
                                 SALES TAX EXEMPTION
 
     PURSUANT TO THE CODE OF ALABAMA, 1975, TITLE 40-23-4 (A) (11), THE
     STATE OF ALABAMA IS EXEMPT FROM PAYING SALES TAX.  AN EXEMPTION LETTER
     WILL BE FURNISHED UPON REQUEST.
 
                                   INVOICES
 
     INQUIRIES CONCERNING PAYMENT AFTER INVOICES HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED ARE
     TO BE DIRECTED TO THE RECEIVING AGENCY, NOT THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING
 
                         BID RESPONSES AND BID RESULTS
 
     UNEVALUATED BID RESPONSES (NOT BID RESULTS) ARE AVAILABLE ON OUR WEB
     SITE AT WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV. BID RESULTS WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE
     FOR REVIEW IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE, BUT ONLY AFTER THE
     BID HAS BEEN AWARDED.  WE DO NOT FAX OR MAIL COPIES OF BID RESULTS.
     IF A VENDOR WISHES TO REVIEW BID RESULTS IN OUR OFFICE, THEY SHOULD
     FAX THEIR REQUEST TO REVIEW THE BID TWO DAYS IN ADVANCE TO THE "BID
     REVIEW CLERK" AT (334) 242-4419.  BE SURE TO REFERENCE THE BID NUMBER.
 
                 FOREIGN CORPORATION - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY
 
     ALABAMA LAW PROVIDES THAT A FOREIGN CORPORATION (AN OUT-OF-STATE
     COMPANY/FIRM) MAY NOT TRANSACT BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF ALABAMA UNTIL
     IT OBTAINS A CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY FROM THE SECRETARY OF STATE.
     SECTION 10-2B-15.01, CODE OF ALABAMA 1975.  TO OBTAIN FORMS FOR A
     CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY, CONTACT THE SECRETARY OF STATE, CORPORATIONS
     DIVISION, (334) 242-5324.  THE CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY DOES NOT KEEP
     THE VENDOR FROM SUBMITTING A BID.
 
                             BID IDENTIFICATION
 
     REFERENCE PAGE 2, ITEM 2.  DUE TO THE POSTAL SERVICE PUTTING BAR CODE
     LABELS ON ENVELOPES, IT CONCEALS THE BID NUMBER AND DATE IF THE VENDOR
     HAS WRITTEN THEM OTHER THAN THE LOWER LEFT CORNER, THEREFORE THE BID
     WOULD BE REJECTED FOR NOT BEING PROPERLY IDENTIFIED.
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     **********************************************************************
 
 
     AWARD:
     THE AWARD SHALL BE MADE TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER MEETING
     ALL SPECIFICATIONS. LOWEST BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED BY LOWEST
     TIME PRICE DIFFERENTIAL.
     ASSIGNMENT OF CONTRACT:
     TO ASSIGN, SUBLET OR TRANSFER ANY CONTRACT RESULTING FROM THIS
     SOLICITATION, THE VENDOR'S WRITTEN REQUEST MUST BE APPROVED BY THE
     STATE PURCHASING DIRECTOR.
 
     NON-APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS:
     CONTINUATION OF ANY AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE STATE AND A BIDDER BEYOND A
     FISCAL YEAR IS CONTINGENT UPON CONTINUED LEGISLATIVE APPROPRIATION OF
     FUNDS FOR THE PURPOSE OF THIS BID AND ANY RESULTING AGREEMENT. NON-
     AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS AT ANY TIME SHALL CAUSE ANY AGREEMENT TO BECOME
     VOID AND UNENFORCEABLE AND NO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES SHALL ACCRUE TO THE
     STATE AS A RESULT. THE STATE WILL NOT INCUR LIABILITY BEYOND THE
     PAYMENT OF ACCRUED AGREEMENT PAYMENT.
 
     PRORATION:
     ANY PROVISION OF A CONTRACT RESULTING FROM THIS BID TO THE CONTRARY
     NOTWITHSTANDING, IN THE EVENT OF FAILURE OF THE STATE TO MAKE PAYMENT
     HEREUNDER AS A RESULT OF PARTIAL UNAVAILABILITY, AT THE TIME SUCH
     PAYMENT IS DUE, OF SUCH SUFFICIENT REVENUES OF THE STATE TO MAKE SUCH
     PAYMENT (PRORATION OF APPROPRIATED FUNDS FOR THE STATE HAVING BEEN
     DECLARED BY THE GOVERNOR PURSUANT TO SECTION 41-4-90 OF THE CODE OF
     ALABAMA 1975), THE CONTRACTOR SHALL HAVE THE OPTION, IN ADDITION TO
     THE OTHER REMEDIES OF THE CONTRACT, OF RENEGOTIATING THE CONTRACT
     (EXTENDING OR CHANGING PAYMENT TERMS OR AMOUNTS) OR TERMINATING THE
     CONTRACT.
 
     BLANK LINES:
     TO EVALUATE THE BID IN AN EFFICIENT MANNER, THE VENDOR SHOULD FILL-IN
     ALL BLANK LINES APPLICABLE TO A SPECIFIC COMMODITY DESCRIPTION.
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  LINE                                                                              EXTENDED
   NO.     COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION        QUANTITY UNIT   UNIT PRICE           AMOUNT
 _____________________________________________________________________________________________
 
        UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BELOW:
       SHIP TO:        017000 / 017M37
       PUBLIC SAFETY
       ABI IDENTIFICATION UNIT
       834 ADAMS AVE
       MONTGOMERY          AL     36104
 
 00001 COMMODITY CODE: 946-54-056214                1    MO    ______________     ______________
       FINANCING FOR EQUIPMENT PER
       STANDARD STATE OF ALABAMA LEASE PUR-
       CHASE AGREEMENT FOR FINANCIAL
       INSTITUTION. PERIOD TO BE 36 MONTHS.
       INTEGRA ID - UPGRADE WITH APPROXIMATE
       AMOUNT OF FINANCING TO BE $2,170,050 PER
       ATTACHED AGREEMENT.(EQUIPMENT ON SNAP#
       1420794)
       EACH BIDDER MUST PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING:
 
       TIME PRICE DIFFERENTIAL: $_______/$1000
 
       MONTHLY PAYMENT:  $______________  *
 
       CONTRACT WILL BEGIN ONLY AFTER ALL
       EQUIPMENT FOR UPGRADE IS DELIVERED,
       INSTALLED, FULLY OPERATIONAL, AND
       ACCEPTED BY AGENCY DIRECTOR.
 
       THE ATTACHED "STATE OF ALABAMA LEASE
       PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR FINANCIAL INSTIT-
       UTIONS" WILL BE EXECUTED AFTER BID OPENS
       AND LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IS
       SELECTED FOR AWARD.
 
       * MONTHLY AMOUNT WILL BE ADJUSTED WHEN
       EXACT PURCHASE PRICE IS DETERMINED. BID
       MUST HAVE "TIME PRICE DIFFERENTIAL"
       AND "MONTHLY PAYMENT" FILLED-IN TO BE
       CONSIDERED FOR AWARD.
 
       REMEMBER TO RETURN ORIGINAL BID AND
       ONE COMPLETE EXACT COPY OF ORIGINAL
       BID TO PURCHASING. READ BID INSTRUCTIONS
       ON PAGE 2 (1-8) OF BID FORM.
 
       (UNIT PRICE IS NOT REQUIRED FOR THIS BID
       -JUST TIME/PRICE DIFFERENTIAL AND
       MONTHLY PAYMENT MUST BE PROVIDED.)
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
            PAGE TOTAL                                                            ______________
 
             BID TOTAL                                                            ______________
 

























NEC

Alabama Bureau of Investigation
301 South Ripley Street
Montgomery, AL  36104

Attn: Lt. Tim Pullin

ABI AFIS Upgrade Line Item Details

AFIS Hardware Components

AFIS Component Details Q'ty

DM/MM Servers

PowerEdge R610 with Chassis for Up to Six 2.5-Inch Hard Drives (224-4848), 12GB Memory 
(6x2GB), 1333Mhz Dual Ranked RDIMMs for 2 Processors (317-1288), X5570 Xeon Processor, 
2.93GHz 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT (317-0200), X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M 
Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT (317-1212), 146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 2.5 inch Hot 
Plug Hard Drive (341-9157) - Qty 5, PERC 6/i SAS RAID Controller 2x4 Connectors, Internal, 
PCIe256MB Cache (341-9254), Windows Server 2008, Standard x64, Incl Hyper-V, Incl 5 CALs 
(420-8354), RAID 5 for PERC 6/i Controller (341-8756), Sliding Ready Rails With 
CableManagement Arm (330-3520), High Output Power Supply Redundant, 717W (330-3518), 
40GB Microsoft OS Partition Override (420-6966), Power Cord, NEMA 5-15P to C14,15 amp, 
wall plug, 10 feet / 3 meter (310-8509)

2

Blade Enclosure 
for MU  Blades

Base Unit: Blade Server Enclosure, No Blades, M1000E, PowerEdge, Redundant Power 
Supplies (6x2360W), High Efficiency M1000E Blade Chassis, Redundant Chassis Management 
Controller, PowerEdge M1000E , Windows Server 2008, Standard Edition, 32 bit and 64 bit 
Media Kit , Dell OpenManage Kit for PowerEdge M610 Blade Server, Dell OpenManage CD Kit 
for PowerEdge M1000E Blade Server Chassis, Redundant GbE Pass-Through Modules, IO Bays 
1+2, 3+4 or 5+6, M1000E, No I/O Modules, (I/O Bay Filler Panels, Qty 2) M1000E Blade Server 
Chassis, No I/O Modules, (I/O Bay Filler Panels, Qty 2) M1000E Blade Server Chassis, 
PowerEdge M-Series Blade Multipack Box Processor FamilyLabel, Intel, Rack Chassis w/Rapid 
Rails forDell, HPQ or other Square HoleRacks, DVD-ROM, 8x, External USB Black, Avocent 
Integrated KVM Analog Switch Module, PowerEdge M1000E Chassis, Power Cords, QTY3, 8FT 
C19/C20 for M1000E Server Blade Chassis  - Quantity 2, 24Amp, 208 Volt, High-Power Power 
Distribution Unit (PDU)  - Quantity 3, Blade Blanking Panel for PowerEdge M1000E Blade Server 
Chassis 

1

NEC Corporation of America
10850 Gold Center Drive, Suite 200
Rancho Cordova, CA  95670
(800) 777-2347



Matching Unit 
Servers

Base Unit: PowerEdge M610 Blade Server, First Processor: X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 
8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, Second Processor: X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M 
Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, Memory: 32GB Memory (8x4GB), 1066MHz Dual Ranked 
RDIMMs for 2 Processors, Adv ECC, Windows Server 2008, Enterprise x64, Incl Hyper-V, Incl 
25 CALs
Onboard Broadcom 5709 Dual Port 1GbE NIC, with TOE, SAS6/IR Hard Drive Controller Card, 
For M-Series Blade Servers, SATA / SAS drives, SAS6/IR Daughtercard, RAID 1 Mirror, 73GB 
15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 2.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, 73GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 2.5" 
Hot Plug Hard Drive 

14   

Image Processing 
Contorller Servers

Base Unit: PowerEdge M610 Blade Server, First Processor: X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 
8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT,Second Processor: X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M 
Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, Memory: 32GB Memory (8x4GB), 1066MHz Dual Ranked 
RDIMMs for 2 Processors, Adv ECC, Windows Server 2008, Standard x64, Incl Hyper-V, Incl 5 
CALs, Onboard Broadcom 5709 Dual Port 1GbE NIC, with TOE, SAS6/IR Hard Drive Controller 
Card, For M-Series Blade Servers, SATA / SAS drives, SAS6/IR Daughtercard, RAID 1 Mirror, 
73GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 2.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, 73GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach 
SCSI 2.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive 

2   

Data X Change 
Servers

Base Unit: PowerEdge R710 with Chassis for Up to Six 3.5-Inch Hard Drives, First processor: 
X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, Second 
processor:X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, 12GB Memory 
(6x2GB), 1333Mhz Dual Ranked RDIMMs for 2 Processors, Embedded Broadcom, GB Ethernet 
NICS with TOE, 
Windows Server 2008, Standard x64, Incl Hyper-V, Incl 5 CALs, 5-pack of Windows Server 2008 
User CALs (Standard or Enterprise), 5-pack of Windows Server 2008 User CALs (Standard or 
Enterprise), 5-pack of Windows Server 2008 User CALs (Standard or Enterprise), PERC 6/i SAS 
RAID Controller 2x4 Connectors, Internal, PCIe256MB Cache, 146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach 
SCSI 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive - Qty 6, RAID 5 for PERC 6/i Controller, 40GB Microsoft OS 
Partition Override, iDRAC6 Express, DVD+/-RW ROM, SATA, Internal, Bezel, Riser with 2 PCIe 
x8 + 2 PCIe x4 Slot, Sliding Ready Rails With CableManagement Arm, High Output Power 
Supply Redundant, 870W, Power Cord, NEMA 5-15P to C14,15 amp, wall plug, 10 feet / 3 
meter, Power Cord, NEMA 5-15P to C14,15 amp, wall plug, 10 feet / 3 meter

2

DXF-TC Servers Intel PRO 1000VT Quad Port 1GbE NIC, PCIe-4 (2 cards per DXF-TC server) 4



Universal Data 
Base Server

Base Unit: PowerEdge T610 Rack Chassis for Up to Eight 3.5-Inch Hard Drives. First processor: 
X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, Second Processor: 
X5570 Xeon Processor, 2.93GHz 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, TurboHT, 24GB Memory (6x4GB), 
1333MHz Dual Ranked RDIMMs for 2 Processors,Optimized, Operating System: Red Hat 
Enterprise Linux 5.2APFI x64, 1yr, Auto-Entitle, Lic& Media, Embedded Broadcom, GB Ethernet 
NICS with TOE 
Intel PRO 1000VT Quad Port 1GbE NIC, PCIe-4 , Intel PRO 1000VT Quad Port 1GbE NIC, 
PCIe-4 
iDRAC6 Express, DVD-RW, SATA, Internal, PERC 6/i SAS RAID Controller 2x4 Connectors, 
Internal, PCIe256MB Cache, RAID 5 for PERC 6/i Controller, 146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach 
SCSI 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, 146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, 
146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach SCSI 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, 146GB 15K RPM Serial-Attach 
SCSI 3.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive, Qlogic 2462 Dual Channel 4GB Optical Fiber Channel HBA PCI-
E Card, Qlogic 2462 Dual Channel 4GB Optical Fiber Channel HBA PCI-E Card, Sliding Ready 
Rails With CableManagement Arm for Rack Configuration, High Output Power Supply 
Redundant, 870W, Power Cord, NEMA 5-15P to C14,15 amp, wall plug, 10 feet / 3 meter, Power 
Cord, NEMA 5-15P to C14,15 amp, wall plug, 10 feet / 3 meter 

2

UDB Servers Intel PRO 1000VT Quad Port 1GbE NIC, PCIe-4 (3 cards per DM/MM server) 4

UDB Servers QLogic 2462 Dual Channel 4Gb Optical Fiber Channel HBA, PCIe ( 2 cards per UDB server) 4

NW Switch PowerConnect 2708, 8 GbE Ports, Web Managed Switch- R 1

Reports Server

PowerEdge R710 Chassis for Up to Eight 2.5-Inch Hard Drives edit , Processor Intel® Xeon® 
X5570, 2.93Ghz, 8M Cache, 6.40 GT/s QPI, Turbo, HT edit, Additional Processor Single 
Processor Only 
Memory 6GB Memory (3x2GB), 1333MHz Dual Ranked UDIMMs for 1 Processor, Optimized 
Operating System Windows Server® 2008, Standard x64 Edition,Includes 5 CALs, Primary 
Controller PERC 6/i SAS RAID Controller, 2x4 Connectors, Internal, PCIe,256MB Cache,x8, 
Hard Drive Configuration RAID 5 for PERC 6/i Controller edit, Hard Drives 300GB 10K RPM 
Serial-Attach SCSI 2.5" Hot Plug Hard Drive - Qty 6, Power Supply High Output Power Supply, 
Redundant, 870W edit 
Power Cords NEMA 5-15P to C14 Wall Plug, 125 Volt, 15 AMP, 10 Feet (3m), Power Cord edit 
OS Partitions 40GB Microsoft OS Partition Override, Embedded NIC Ports Dual Two-Port 
Embedded Broadcom® NetXtreme II 5709 Gigabit Ethernet NIC, Microsoft SQL Server 
Microsoft® SQL Server™ 2005X64 Standard (1 Socket),OEM,NFI, Client Access Licenses 15-
pack of Windows® Server 2008 User CALs (Standard or Enterprise), Riser Card Riser with 2 
PCIe x8 + 2 PCIe x4 Slot, Rails Sliding Ready Rails With Cable Management Arm, Bezel, 
Internal Optical Drive DVD+/-RW ROM, SATA, Internal

1

SAN Storage

D3-10 Disk Array Unit, 4GB cache (2GB per controller), dual controllers, dual power supplies, 
LAN port, Storage Manager software, Access Control, Reallocation Control, PathManager, 
SAS/SATA Disk Enclosure - Qty 1 (12 disks per enclosure), Option Host Port(4Port->8Port) (D3 
only), Extended Battery Backup Unit (1U), SATA Disk Drive (7200RPM/1TB) x 14 disks, SAS 
Disk Drive(15krpm/146GB) x 9 disks

1

FC SAN Switch Base Unit: Brocade 300 8-16-24 Port FC4 Switch, Rapid Rails for Brocade 200/300 Switches 2



Tape Library
PowerVault TL2000, 2U Library, LTO4-120, 800GB/1.6TB, 1 Native Fibre Drive, Tape Media: 
Tape Media for LTO4-120 tape drive, 800GB/1.6TB, 20 Pack, Cable: Multi-Mode FC Cable, LC-
LC, for FC2 switch, 10 meters

1

42U RACK
For Rack mounted  

Servers

Dell 4220 42U Rack with Doors and Side Panels, Ground Ship NOT for AK / HI (224-4934), 1U 
KMM Console with Touchpad Keyboard and 17 LCD, Rapid Rails (310-9961), 16 Port , 
eyboard/Video/Mouse Analog Switch, 2160AS PowerEdge (221-7994), 16Amp, 120 Volt, Power 
Distribution Unit (PDU) (310-1877) - Quantity 3

1

42U RACK
For Blades

Base Unit: Dell 4210 42U Rack with Doors and Side Panels
24 Amp, 208V PDUs included in the Blade Enclosure specs

1

NW Switch PowerConnect 5424,24 GbE PortsManaged Switch, Layer 2, iSCSIoptimized (223-4644) 4

NW Switch Power 
Supply

RPS-600, External Redundant Power Supply for PowerConnect - Supports 4 Units 1

Latent Workstation 
- Central Site

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760. Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 
250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 in 1 Media Card 
Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, Opti, Black, Dell 
USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex , 48X32 CDRW/DVD Combo,Dell 
OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, 
Power Cord 125V ,2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

2

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

2

Latent camera with 
accessories

Sony XC-ST51 LATENT Camera, • MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V, • Kaiser RS Copy Stand 
KACSRS2, • Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701, • Sony Power Supply DC-700  Pentax Lens 
C32500
Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

2

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 2



Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

2

B & W Laser 
printer

HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 2

USB Cable USB cable 2

Latent Workstation 
- Central Site    

NEC to replace PC 
/ Monitor   

hardware at No 
costs

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex 
RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex755 
Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 in 1 Media 
Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, Opti, Black 
Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD Combo,Dell 
OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply 
Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

1

Latent camera with 
accessories

Re-use Current 1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

B & W Laser 
printer

Re-use Current 1

USB Cable Re-use Current 1

Latent Workstation 
MCSO

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Reader for Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black, Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient 
Power Supply , Power Cord, 125V, 2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

1



Latent camera with 
accessories

• Sony XC-ST51 Latent Camera 
• MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V
• Kaiser RS Copy Stand KACSRS2
• Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701
• Sony Power Supply DC-700
• Pentax Lens C32500
• Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

B & W Laser 
printer

HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 1

USB Cable USB cable 1

Latent Workstation 
- Hoover PD    

NEC To replace
PC / Monitor   

hardware at No 
costs

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex,Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black. Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex , 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient 
Power Supply Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

1

Latent camera with 
accessories

Re-use current 1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

B & W Laser 
printer

Re-use current 1

USB Cable Re-use current 1



Latent Workstation 
- Jeff County

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower 
250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex Dell 19 in 1 Media Card 
Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, Opti, Black, Dell 
USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD Combo,Dell 
OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, 
Power Cord, 125V, 2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

1

Latent camera with 
accessories

• Sony XC-ST51 LATENT Camera 
• MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V
• Kaiser RS Copy Stand KACSRS2
• Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701
• Sony Power Supply DC-700
• Pentax Lens C32500
• Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

B & W Laser 
printer

HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 1

USB Cable USB cable 1



Latent Workstation 
- Gadsden PD

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black, Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower 
OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell 
OptiPlex, 

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude 

1

Latent camera with 
accessories

• Sony XC-ST51 LATENT Camera 
• MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V
• Kaiser RS Copy Stand KACSRS2
• Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701
• Sony Power Supply DC-700
• Pentax Lens C32500
• Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

B & W Laser 
printer

HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 1

USB Cable USB cable 1

Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -
Central Site 

Replace Existing 

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black, Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower 
OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell 
OptiPlex, 

7

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude

7

Flat bed scanner Epson Perfection V700 Flat bed scanner 7
B/W Laser Pringer HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 7



USB Cable USB cable 7

Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -
Central Site                                

NEC To replace
PC / Monitor 

hardware at No 
costs

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black, Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower 
OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell 
OptiPlex, 

3

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude

3

Flat bed scanner Epson Perfection V700 Flat bed scanner 3
B & W Laser 

printer
HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 3

USB Cable USB cable 3

Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -
Central Site New 

Procurement

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex, 
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex, RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
OptiPlex755 Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 
in 1 Media Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, 
Opti, Black, Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD 
Combo,Dell OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower 
OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, Power Cord,125V,2M,C13,Dell 
OptiPlex, 

2

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude

2

Flat bed scanner Epson Perfection V700 Flat bed scanner 2
B & W Laser 

printer
HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 2

USB Cable USB cable 2



Tenprint, 
Verification, NSW 

& Latent 
Workstation -

Birmingham PD

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex 
RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex755 
Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 in 1 Media 
Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, Opti, Black, 
Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD Combo,Dell 
OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, 
Power    Cord, 125V, 2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex, 

2

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude

2

:Latent camera 
with accessories

• Sony XC-ST51 LATENT Camera 
• MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V
• Kaiser RS Copy Stand KACSRS2
• Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701
• Sony Power Supply DC-700
• Pentax Lens C32500
• Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

2

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 2

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

2

Flat bed scanner Epson Perfection V700 Flat bed scanner 2
B & W Laser 

printer
HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 2

USB Cable USB cable 2

Tenprint,  & Latent 
Workstation -  

MPD

Base Unit: OptiPlex 960 Minitower Base Upto 88 Percent Efficient PSU, Processor: Core2 Quad 
QUAD, 9400/ 2.66GHz6M, 1333FSB, Memory: 8.0GB,Non-ECC,800MHz DDR 4x2GB Dell 
OptiPlex 960 and 760, Vista Business,Service Pack 1 with Media,64 Bit,English,DellOptiplex
Video Card: 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 Graphics dual DVI and VGA and TV Out, 
FH,OptiPlex 
RAID 1, Dell OptiPlex 960, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex755 
Minitower, 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB Data Burst Cache,Dell OptiPlex, Dell 19 in 1 Media 
Card Readerfor Dell OptiPlex 960 Minitower, Dell, USB, Quiet KYBD, No Hot Keys, Opti, Black, 
Dell USB 2 Button Optical Mouse with Scroll,Black OptiPlex, 48X32 CDRW/DVD Combo,Dell 
OptiPlex Desktop or Minitower, OptiPlex 960 Minitower Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply, 
Power    Cord, 125V, 2M,C13,Dell OptiPlex,

1

Monitor
Dell UltraSharp 2408WFP,Wide Flat Panel w/Height AdjustableStand,24.0 Inch VIS,OptiPlex 
Precision and Latitude

1



Latent camera with 
accessories

• Sony XC-ST51 LATENT Camera 
• MI-150DG Illuminator w/IRIS 115V
• Kaiser RS Copy Stand KACSRS2
• Tripod Adapter Mount VCT-ST701
• Sony Power Supply DC-700
• Pentax Lens C32500
• Cosmicar Extension tube C90100

1

Latent Camera 
Interface card

Frame Grabber DFG/SV1  Interface card 1

Latent Camera 
Interface 

Connector

BNC – Phono cables for connecting each card to each camera. The camera side has BNC 
connector and the Card has Phono

1

Flat bed scanner Epson Perfection V700 Flat bed scanner 1
B & W Laser 

printer
HP 3005 (Direct Connect printer) 1

USB Cable USB cable 1

Scanner Station

Base Unit: Dell Precision T7400 Mini-Tower, Quad Core Xeon Proc E5440, 2.83GHz, 2X6MB L2 
Cache,1333MHz 
Processor: 2nd Processor, Quad Core Xeon Proc E5440, 2.83GHz, 2X 6MB L2Cache,1333MHz, 
Dell Precision T7400 
Memory: 2GB, DDR2 ECC SDRAM Memory 667MHz, 2X1GB, Dell Precision T5400 
Keyboard: Entry Level, USB, No Hot Keys keyboards, Dell PrecisionWorkstations 
Monitor:  Dell UltraSharp 2007FP Flat Panel with Height Adjustable Stand,20.0 Inch 
VIS,OptiPlex Workstation,Latitude 
Video Card:  nVidia,NVS 290, 256MB dual DVIGraphics Card, Dell Precision T3400 
Hard Drive: 80GB SATA,10K RPM 3.0Gb/s 2.5 inch,SATA2 16MB Data Burst Cache,Dell 
Precision 
Hard Drive Controller: C5 All SATA Hard Drives Non- RAID for 5 Hard Drives Dell Precision 
T7400 
Floppy Disk Drive: Internal USB Media card reader19:1, Dell Precision T7400 
Operating System: Windows XP PRO SP3 with Windows Vista Business LicenseEnglish,Dell 
Precision 
Mouse:  Dell USB 2-Button Entry Mouse with Scroll for Dell Precision 
CD-ROM or DVD-ROM Drive: 48X/32X/48X CD-RW/DVD Combo Drive, Data Only, Dell 
Precision T3400 
CD-ROM or DVD-ROM Drive: Cyberlink Power DVD 8.1,No Media,Dell OptiPlex/Precision 
Speakers:  Internal Chassis Speaker, DellPrecision T7400 
Additional Storage Products:  80GB SATA,10K RPM Add 3.0Gb/s 2.5 inch,SATA2 16MB Data 
BurstCache,Dell Precision
Misc: 80GB SATA,10K RPM Add 3.0Gb/s 2.5 inch,SATA2 16MB Data BurstCache,Dell 
Precision 
Misc: 80GB SATA,10K RPM Add 3.0Gb/s 2.5 inch,SATA2 16MB Data BurstCache,Dell 
Precision 
Misc: 80GB SATA,10K RPM Add 3.0Gb/s 2.5 inch,SATA2 16MB Data BurstCache,Dell Precis

2



Dell 20 inch UltraSharp™ 2007FP Flat Panel, adjustable stand, VGA/DVI 2
IQS Appendix F certified scanner 2
Auto Document Feeder 2

Document Scanner  
Workstation -
Central Site-

Replacement of 
CBM Archive 
workstations

Operating SystemGenuine Windows Vista® Business Service Pack 1, 64-bit; media, English 
OptiPlex 960 Small Form Factor Standard Power Supply, Processors Intel® Core™ 2 Quad 
Processor Q9400 (2.66GHz, 6M, 1333MHz FSB), Memory 4GB DDR2 Non-ECC 
SDRAM,800MHz, (2 DIMM), Integrated Video, Intel® GMA 4500, Monitors Dell 22 inch, All In 
One, 2208WFP, Adjustable Stand, VGA/DVI, Dell Quietkey, No Hot Keys, English, Black, Dell 
USB Optical Mouse with Scroll, All Black Design, Mouse Pad, Boot Hard Drives160GB 2.5, 
SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB DataBurst Cache edit, Second Hard Drive Options160GB 2.5, SATA 
3.0Gb/s and 8MB DataBurst Cache, RAID 1
8X Slimline DVD+/-RW Roxio Creator™ CyberlinkPowerDVD™, vPro Secure Advanced 
Hardware Enabled Systems Management, Resource DVD - contains Diagnostics and Drivers for 
Vista systems

3

Monitors Dell 22 inch, All In One, 2208WFP, Adjustable Stand, VGA/DVI 3

Quoted in the past 
in a separate Bill of 

Materials

Fujitsu fi-6140 Color Duplex Scanner:, Fast, 60 ppm/120 ipm scanning in monochrome and 
grayscale, 300 dpi color scanning at 40 ppm/80 ipm, Robust 50-page Automatic Document 
Feeder (ADF) with enhanced hard and embossed card scanning (including credit or healthcare 
cards) 
Bundled with Kofax® VRS® Professional, Adobe® Acrobat® Standard, and ScandAll Pro 
imaging software 

2

Quoted in the past 
in a separate Bill of 

Materials

Fujitsu fi-6240 Scanner: Fast, 60 ppm/120 ipm scanning in monochrome and grayscale, 300 dpi 
color scanning at 40 ppm/80 ipm, Intelligent MultiFeed Function (iMFF) as well as advanced 
Paper Protection technology, Robust 50-page Automatic Document Feeder (ADF) with 
enhanced hard and embossed card scanning; easily scans credit or healthcare cards), Full 
versions of Kofax® VRS® Professional, Adobe® Acrobat® Standard, and ScandAll Pro imaging 
software

1

Quoted in the past 
in a separate Bill of 

Materials
Black Document Cover PA03540-D801 (For Fujitsu fi-6240) 1

Print Server 
Workstation -

Energy Efficiency Options Energy Star 4.0 Category B (<65W Idle), EPEAT Gold, Dell ESMART 
Settings, OPTIPLEX 960S OptiPlex 960 Small Form Factor Base Up to 88 Percent Efficient PSU
Power Supplies OptiPlex 960 Small Form Factor Up to 88 Percent Efficient Power Supply 
Processors Intel® Core™ 2 Duo Processor E8400 (3.0GHz, 6M, 1333MHz FSB), Operating 
System Genuine Windows Vista® Business Downgrade,XP Professional Installed,E Memory 
2GB DDR2 Non-ECC SDRAM, 800MHz, (1DIMM), Video Cards Integrated Video, Intel® GMA 
4500, Keyboard Dell Quietkey, No Hot Keys, English, Black , Mouse Dell USB Optical Mouse 
with Scroll, All Black Design 
Mouse Pad Mouse Pad, Monitors Dell 19 inch UltraSharp™ 1908FP Flat Panel, height 
adjustable stand, V, Boot Hard Drives 160GB 2.5, SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB DataBurst Cache, 
Second Hard Drive Options None, Floppy Drive Options Dell 19 in 1 Media Card Reader, CD 
ROM/DVD ROM 24X Slimline CDRW/DVD Combo, Roxio Creator™ Cyberlink Power DVD™ 

2



Dell 19 inch UltraSharp™ 1908FP Flat Panel, height adjustable stand 2
Xerox Phaser 4510DT 2
256mb memory for phaser 4510  [256 Mb Phaser Memory: Part#: 097S03777] 2

Hardware Total $           453,424 

Middleware

AFIS Component Details Q'ty

UDB Server Oracle 11g Database Standard Edition.  ASFU, Processor based License 4

UDB Server
Oracle 11g Database RAC Option.  ASFU, Processor based License 
Part of Standard Edition. Can be used at no additional costs since we do not exceed total 4 
sockets in cluster

4

UDB Server

Includes : BakBone WorkGRoup for Linux - Qty 1, BakBone 20 Media Slots - Qty 1, BakBone 
1 Media slot - Qty 4,  Bakbone Oracle Standard Edition APM License for Linux - Qty 1, 
BakBone Single Heterogeneous Client (Linux/Unix/Windows/MAC/NetWare) - Qty 1 , 
BAKBONE ONE YEAR PRODUCT UPGRADES & SUPPORT CONTRACT 8X5 OPTION - Qty 
1

1

UDB Server Acronis True Image Enterprise Server - ( v. 9.1 ) - license 2

IPC Server WSQ 2

Print Server 
Workstation -
Central Site

Accuprint Server 2

Print Server 
Workstation -
Central Site

NISTPack For Workstation 2

MVS FedSubmit- MS 2

Latent Workstation 
- Central Site WSQ 3



Latent Workstation 
- MCSO

WSQ 1

Latent Workstation 
- Hoover PD

WSQ 1

Latent Workstation 
- Jeff County

WSQ 1

Latent Workstation 
- Gadsden PD

WSQ 1

Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -
Central Site ( 7 
replacement, 3 
reuse, 2 new)

WSQ 12

Tenprint, 
Verification, NSW 

& Latent 
Workstation -

Birmingham PD

WSQ 2

Tenprint  & Latent 
Workstation - MPD

WSQ 1

Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -
Central Site ( 7 
replacement, 3 
reuse, 2 new)

Runtime API for Epson V700 (For NSW Component to achieve IQS certified Scanning) 12

Tenprint, 
Verification, NSW 

& Latent 
Workstation -

Birmingham PD

Runtime API for Epson V700 (For NSW Component to achieve IQS certified Scanning) 2

Middleware Total $           168,440 



AFIS Application Programs

Details Q'ty

DXF Core Module (F & P) Enterprise_Tier 4 1

DXF Slap Matching_Tier 4 1

DXF FUSION Matching_Tier 4 1

DXF IPC_Tier 4 2

DXF System Administration Core SW_Tier 4 1

DXF Reports Database SW_Tier 4 1

DXF AFIS ULW - Inbound & Outbound Server_Tier 4 1

DXF AFIS CCH Interface _Tier 4 1

DXF AFIS Livescan Interface_Tier 4 1

DXF AFIS NIST SSO Interface_Tier 4 1

DXF AFIS ESSO Interface_Tier 4 1

Matching Subsystem 1

DXF Archive Module (Required for Meta Search)_Tier 4 1

DXF WS Data Entry and Scan_Tier 4 3

DXF Archive Client Licenses (1-100 Users)_Tier 4 1

DXF Archive Manager License_Tier 4 1

DXF Print Server_Tier 4 2

Latent Workstation 
- Central Site

DXF Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 3

Latent Workstation 
- MCSO

DXF Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 1

Latent Workstation 
- Hoover PD

DXF Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 1

Latent Workstation 
- Jeff County

DXF Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 1

Latent Workstation 
- Gadsden PD

DXF Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 1



Tenprint, 
Verification & NSW 

Workstation -)
DXF Tenprint , Verification, Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 12

Tenprint, 
Verification, NSW 

& Latent 
Workstation -

Birmingham PD

DXF Tenprint , Verification, NSW, Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 2

Tenprint  & Latent 
Workstation - MPD

DXF Tenprint , Latent Workstation (Finger and Palm) - New 1

AFIS Application Program Total $         1,608,575

Delivery and Installation, System Integration, Training, and Project Management Hours Cost

Warranty Upgrade
Shipping and Delivery

Mentalix Customization 

NEC-Tokyo Customization, Coding and offsite testing 450

Requirement Analysis (Integra Group) 160

Specifications (Integra Group) 160

Customization, Coding (Integra Group) 960

Offsite System Testing (Integra Group) 240

Offsite System Testing (RC Engineering Group) 640

Remote Support (Integra Group) 120

Remote Support (RC Engineering Group) 180

Onsite System Testing - Zone Personnel 400

Project Management (Integra Group) 120

Project Management (Zone personnel) 120

User Guides 160

Training and Documentation, Training related travel
Total System Integration and Other

                      -   

$825,969 



Upgrade Cost Summary
Hardware

Middleware Total
AFIS Application Programming
System Integration and Other

AFIS Upgrade Sub-total
AFIS Application Discount

$453,424
$169,440

$1,608,575
$825,969

$3,056,408
($886,358)

Grand Total AFIS Upgrade                   $2,170,050



 
                                                   INVITATION TO BID NO: 2208821    ADDENDUM NO: 01
                      
 
                         STATE OF ALABAMA
 
                      DEPTARTMENT OF FINANCE       REQ. AGENCY        : 017000
                      DIVISION OF PURCHASING                           PUBLIC SAFETY
                                                   AGENCY REQ. NO.    : 946926
                                                   T-NUMBER           :
                                                   DATE ISSUED        : 07/28/09
                    INVITATION TO BID ADDENDUM     VENDOR NO.         :
                                                   VENDOR PHONE NO.   :
                                                   SNAP REQ. NO.      : 1420807
                                                   BUYER NAME         : RAY BRESSLER
  FOR:    INTEGRA ID UPGRADE LEASE PURCHASE        BUYER PHONE NO.    : (334) 242-4670
          ABI / LATENT PRINT
 
 
 
 
 
 
                                                        BID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:
                                                        DATE:  08/13/09  TIME:  5:00  PM
 
 
                                                        BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
                                                        DATE:  08/14/09  TIME:  10:00 AM
 
 
 
                       PLEASE READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS CAREFULLY
 
          THE FOLLOWING CHANGES ARE HEREBY ADDED TO AND MADE A PART OF
                       (INVITATION TO BID NUMBER 2208821   )
 
     THIS SOLICITATION IS FOR FINANCING THE UPGRADE OF THE LATENT PRINT
     SYSTEM AS MANDATED BY FEDERAL GUIDELINES. THE COMPONENTS LIST
     REQUIRED FOR THE UPGRADE (AT PRESENT - LATEST MODEL COMPONENTS WILL
     BE USED IF POSSIBLE) ARE NOW ATTACHED TO THIS SOLICITATION FOR
     INFORMATIONAL PURPOSE OF ALLOWING BETTER IDEA ON EQUIPMENT TO BE
     FINANCED. BIDDERS WILL VIEW "OPEN BIDS" SECTION OF OUR WEBSITE
     WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV AND SEE ATTACHMENT TO THIS ITB. BID RETURN
     AND BID OPEN DATES ARE NOT CHANGED.
 * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *  END OF ADDENDUM * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
                               STATEMENT OF UNDERSTANDING
 
       I UNDERSTAND THE ADDENDUM AND THAT IT MUST BE SIGNED IN INK AND RETURNED
       (UNLESS INDICATED OTHERWISE) WITH THE BID OR SEPARATELY, PROPERLY IDENTIFIED AND
       RECEIVED PRIOR TO DATE AND TIME SPECIFIED.
 
                                _________________________     _________________________
                                COMPANY NAME                  AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (INK)
 
    ADDENDUM NOTARIZATION       _________________________     _________________________
    NOT REQUIRED                MAIL ADDRESS                  TYPE/PRINT AUTHORIZED NAME
 
                                _________________________     _________________________
                                CITY, STATE, ZIP
 
                                _________________________     _________________________
                                PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE


